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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 29 September 2020 12:34 PM
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Cc: Jason Tea
Subject: [MANDATE GIVEN] RE: SEEK MANDATE QUANTUM [Express Settlement via LKK] - 

D20003060MFSH/1 // Our ref: CC6/FCI20008031/Uds3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
SH9490S AND SGW2770T ON 31/07/2020]

Dear Jia Le, 
 
We refer to your below email. 
 
We agree to your recommendation to settle the matter @ $5,497.45 (all in). 
 
Thank you. 
 
Kind Regards, 
 
Vic Sanghilan 
Motor Claim Department 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  
| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3846 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
|Company Regn. No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 28 September 2020 10:44 am 
To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE QUANTUM [Express Settlement via LKK] - D20003060MFSH/1 // Our 
ref: CC6/FCI20008031/Uds3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH9490S AND SGW2770T ON 31/07/2020] 
 
Dear Vic, 
 
Market Value: $14,000 
LTA Rebate: $9,303 
Nett Value: $4,697 
 
Enclosed herewith the supporting documents for your perusal. 
 
Thank you. 
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan [mailto:vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg]  
Sent: Monday, 28 September 2020 10:26 AM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Cc: Jason Tea 
Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE QUANTUM [Express Settlement via LKK] - D20003060MFSH/1 // Our 
ref: CC6/FCI20008031/Uds3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH9490S AND SGW2770T ON 31/07/2020] 
 
Dear Jia Le, 
 
We refer to your below email. 
 
Since TP vehicle is a 2007 registered vehicle, kindly also provide to us the Nett Value of the vehicle for 
record purposes. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Kind Regards, 
 
Vic Sanghilan 
Motor Claim Department 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  
| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3846 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
|Company Regn. No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 28 September 2020 8:42 am 
To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE QUANTUM [Express Settlement via LKK] - D20003060MFSH/1 // Our 
ref: CC6/FCI20008031/Uds3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH9490S AND SGW2770T ON 31/07/2020] 
 
Claim No: D20003060MFSH/1 
LKK Ref: CC6/FCI20008031/Uds3 
 
Dear Sirs/Madam, 
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ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 9490S AND SGW 2770T ON 31/07/2020 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer “QUAN DE MOTOR TRADING” at $5,497.45(all-in). 
 
The summary is as follows:- 
 

 Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair  $ 11,331.60 $ 4,650.00 
2. Loss of Use (12days x $100) $   1,200.00 $     840.00 (12days x $70) 
3. LTA Search Fee $            7.45 $         7.45 
                                                                             Total $ 12,539.05 $ 5,497.45 

 
Surveyor recommended 10 days for repair + 2Sunday = 12days. 
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval/instruction. 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan [mailto:vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg]  
Sent: Wednesday, 26 August 2020 3:44 PM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Cc: Jason Tea 
Subject: RE: [Express Settlement via LKK] - D20003060MFSH/1 // Our ref: CC6/FCI20008031/Uds3 
[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH9490S AND SGW2770T ON 31/07/2020] 
 
Dear Jia Le, 
 
We refer to your below email. 
 
We agree to your recommendations on liability and please proceed with Express Settlement.  
 
Thank you. 
 
Kind Regards, 
 
Vic Sanghilan 
Motor Claim Department 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  
| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3846 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
|Company Regn. No. 195000106C  



4

A Member of  Insurance Group 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 26 August 2020 9:52 am 
To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: PROPOSAL ON LIABILITY [Express Settlement via LKK] - D20003060MFSH/1 // Our ref: 
CC6/FCI20008031/Uds3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH9490S AND SGW2770T ON 31/07/2020] 
 
Dear Vic, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Liability: 100%  
 
Remarks: From the video, insured driver turning right without green arrow, third party has the right of way. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval on liability. 
 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan [mailto:vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg]  
Sent: Wednesday, 26 August 2020 9:26 AM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Cc: Jason Tea 
Subject: RE: REQUEST VIDEO FOOTAGE [Express Settlement via LKK] - D20003060MFSH/1 // Our 
ref: CC6/FCI20008031/Uds3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH9490S AND SGW2770T ON 31/07/2020] 
 
Dear Jia Le,  
 
Please refer to below link for the video footage. 
 
Download Link - Expires on 2020-09-09  00:00   GMT+0800 
CT20070426 SH9490S 31-07-2020 FAF (online-video-cutter.com).mp4   (20.3 MB) 
https://secure.justattach.com/download.php?T=86yj3UjORr1mQneq3IvBJ4UqO0poC7484Pir-2sA-
vnTKS4dx8SpWiilLRkiqOqDScwRvQap2ar90jPAu7p8Hw 
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Please take note of the below:  

The video footage is confidential information.  In possessing, using or viewing the CCTV footage, you do 
not acquire any rights, title or interest in the CCTV footage and undertake to preserve its confidentiality.  By 
downloading, using or viewing the video, you agree that you will not disclose, provide, reproduce, store, 
transmit or otherwise make available the CCTV footage, in whole or in part, to your client or any third 
party.All our rights are hereby reserved. 

Thank you. 

Kind Regards, 
 
Vic Sanghilan 
Motor Claim Department 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  
| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3846 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
|Company Regn. No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 25 August 2020 5:40 pm 
To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: REQUEST VIDEO FOOTAGE [Express Settlement via LKK] - D20003060MFSH/1 // Our ref: 
CC6/FCI20008031/Uds3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH9490S AND SGW2770T ON 31/07/2020] 
 
Dear Vic, 
 
Kindly assist to forward us a copy of insured’s video footage for our viewing. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 


