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Hsiao Tong

From: Hsiao Tong

Sent: Tuesday, 6 January, 2015 12:48 PM

To: 'rahul rahul'

Subject: RE: <Request for scene photos>ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGV 712E AND SGH 4431M 

ON 29/07/2014

Attachments: TP scene photo.jpg

Dear Mr Kumaran, 
 
Enclosed here with the scene photos provided by third party for your perusal. 
 
We have reviewed the matter and based on the circumstances of accident, we are of the opinion that the case most 
likely would be settled at equal liability as both parties were cutting lane. Third party’s front right tyre slightly turning 
right but our vehicle’s position also not within the lane. As such, without further delay as Third Party may forward the 
case to the solicitors which will escalate the cost, we will be proceeding to negotiate and settle the third party claim if 
we do not receive your advice by 19/01/2015.  
 
We wish to stress that our offer of settlement is strictly made on a without prejudice basis with a view to close this 
matter amicably. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial 
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will 
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
Please call us if you have any queries. 
 
Best regards, 
Chew Hsiao Tong 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
51 Ubi Ave 1 
#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
(S) 408933 
DID: 6742 3197 
Fax: 6741 4108 
Email: chewht@lkkauto.com 
 
From: rahul rahul [mailto:rahuldidu5@gmail.com]  

Sent: Saturday, 27 September, 2014 6:15 AM 

To: Hsiao Tong 
Subject: Re: <Request for scene photos>ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGV 712E AND SGH 4431M ON 29/07/2014 

 

Attached per request. .pls take note of the tyres turning to right which caused the accident...Thank 
you .Hope to hear justice from you.gd day 

On 26 Sep 2014 08:10, "Hsiao Tong" <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Our Ref: CC6/AXA14014419/Gpb3 

  

Dear Kumaran, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGV 712E AND SGH 4431M ON 29/07/2014 
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We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd (AXA) to resolve the claim 
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 

  

As per our tele-conversation yesterday, please forward the accident scene photographs for our review. 

  

Appreciate an early reply. 

  

Best regards, 

Chew Hsiao Tong 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

51 Ubi Ave 1 

#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 

(S) 408933 

DID: 6742 3197 

Fax: 6741 4108 

Email: chewht@lkkauto.com 

  


