Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, July 14, 2022 2:37 PM

To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Reports (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: 20/20/20/VC00/023513: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YM 8542K (Ol)
and GBH 5870G (TP) on 01/08/2020 [External Confidential]

Attachments: DV - GBH 5870G.PDF

Dear Kenny,

Please see attached amended DV.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE [mailto:kennylim@lonpac.com]

Sent: Thursday, July 14, 2022 11:14 AM

To: Reports (LKKAuto) <report@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: 20/20/20/VC00/023513: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YM 8542K (Ol) and GBH 5870G (TP) on
01/08/2020 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential

Dear Team

Please ignore my previous email. With reference to the above matter, the contents of the DV
was wrong.

Hence, we appreciate if you can assist to obtain the amended DV for our processing.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706



The all CNeW? |[onpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 March 2021 10:55 am

To: 'Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)' <jasperchua@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Reports (LKKAuto) <report@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 20/20/20/VC00/023513: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YM 8542K (Ol) and GBH 5870G (TP) on
01/08/2020 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential

Dear Jasper

Please let us have the amended DV soon.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all CNeW? |[onpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices.

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE

Sent: Thursday, 21 January 2021 5:47 pm

To: 'Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)'

Cc: MT_Claim_SG ; Reports (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: 20/20/20/VC00/023513: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YM 8542K (Ol) and GBH 5870G (TP) on
01/08/2020 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Jasper

Have you send the amended DV to us todate?



Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all CNeW? |[onpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices.

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 November 2020 1:33 pm

To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE

Cc: MT_Claim_SG ; Reports (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: 20/20/20/VC00/023513: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YM 8542K (Ol) and GBH 5870G (TP) on
01/08/2020 [External Confidential]

Dear Kenny.

We are currently still pending TP owner to re-sign the DV.
Kindly on-hold the payment.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE

Sent: Thursday, 26 November 2020 1:28 PM

To: Reports (LKKAuto)

Cec: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) ; MT Claim SG

Subject: RE: 20/20/20/VC00/023513: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YM 8542K (OI) and GBH
5870G (TP) on 01/08/2020 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential

Dear Joanne



Please let us have your reply to our email below.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all THeW" |onpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or
corrupt practices.

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE

Sent: Wednesday, 4 November 2020 7:16 pm

To: 'Joanne Lee (LKK Auto)' <report@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)' <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>; MT Claim SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: RE: 20/20/20/VC00/023513: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YM 8542K (OI) and GBH
5870G (TP) on 01/08/2020 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential

Dear Joanne

The DV states the cheque to be issued to “Hui Yang Motor Pte Ltd”.
But the workshop involved is Fastech Auto PL.

Please confirm again.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all THeW" |onpac.com.sg




We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or
corrupt practices.

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Joanne Lee (LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 October 2020 2:45 pm

To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@]lonpac.com>

Cec: 'Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)' <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>

Subject: 20/20/20/VC00/023513: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YM 8542K (OI) and GBH 5870G
(TP) on 01/08/2020

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that the above-mentioned case had been settled.
Enclose herewith final report & relevant documents for your necessary action please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

JOANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933
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