Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 August 2020 6:23 PM
To: Winson Tan

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: sfw 1922r after paint done photos
Attachments: SFW 1922 finalize.pdf

Dear Winson,
Kindly refer our finalize $1650 (L/S, before GST). 3 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Winson Tan [mailto:winson_tingwei@hotmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, August 11, 2020 11:52 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: sfw 1922r after paint done photos

hi steve.. here enclosed with sfw 1922r after paint done photos for your closed case finalized

best regards: winson tan

Virus-free. www.avast.com

.. thanks..



