Cama Taiping Insurance (Singspore) Pte Litd

3 Anson Road

#15-00

Springleaf Tower Singapore
Singapore 079909

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Dear Sir/ Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOSDY 9018L & GBJ 786F ALON¢,
SIMEIL ST 3 ON 29/07/2020.

We understand that you are the insurer of GBJ 786F vehicle,

I/We wish to inform you that my/our vehicle SDY 9018L have been completed ropairs o
my/our satisfaction by M/s LEANG AUTOMOTIVE. 1/We therefore propose to claim from
your as follows;

3 Cost of Repairs 83§ 3,300.00
2. Loss of Use/Rentat (S$60  x 8 days) S 480.00
TOTAL S8 3.780.90

Please let us have your reply soonest possible

Thank you,

Yours faithfully
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Signed by “the workshop” (with chop)




pate: 301 ?’\)7/0

To:  M/s Leang Automotive
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

#0168
Singapore 417883
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MOTOR_CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Policy No : DMCVSN3I0703€190:1 Claim Ko : SHM2DD2026921/3
Claimant : LUM WAI CHRI
Amount H $83,780.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS THREE THOUSRWD SEVEN HUNDRED AaND EIGHTY
ONLY

I/We agree to accept the above mentionsd amount tc be paid to me/us in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for Iinjuriass / damagses
sustained by me/us through an accident involving

Claimant Vehicle No. : SDY 9%018L

Insured Vehicle No. ! GBJ 78¢p
Date of Loss : 29/07/2020
Place of Accident : BIMEY 87 .3

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to ms/un of the aforementionsd zum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PFTE. LTD., I/We agree ahsolutely te
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) FTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Name : DAWOOD TRADING & WHOLESALE
Driver Name ¢+ PACKIR MOBAMED JIYARUDEEN

from all claims, present or futurs in respect of all 1lnss, injury ox damage
sustained by me/us arising cut of the sald accidenc.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPOEE) PTE. LTD.

(1) Generxal Damages 33
(2) Cost of Repalr/Eseess 83 3,200.00
(3} Loss of Use/Rerntel/Basning 33 480.00

(4) GIA/Police Reports/

Investigation Results/Secarch Fees 8%
[5) Medical Reperes/Expenses 55
{8) Survey Fees/P.T. Fees 55
{7) Ceost including Disbursement ES
FOTRE & = & 5o e o o % % & = m w v S99 3,780.00
Clzimant Name : LUM WAI CHAI wRIc Mo : S (BAHEZ|
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Auto Bay @ Kaki Bukit 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-68 Singapore 417883
Tel: 6909 3048 Fax:6909 3046

Vehicle No: = Dllf qo @L

LEANG AUTOMOTIVE

VI/S CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD Vehicle Model: __ RUSH
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\uthorised Signature For LEANG'AUTOMOTIVE



Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 30 October 2020 1:03 PM

To: dawoodspices@singnet.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 786P AND SDY 9018L ON 29/07/2020

Our Ref: CC6/CTI20007882/Ada3

DAWOOD TRADING & WHOLESALE
[POLICYHOLDER]

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 786P AND SDY 9018L ON 29/07/2020

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,
Chan Jia Le | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 22 February 2021 1:43 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBJ786P (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND SDY9018L (TP
: LKK REF - CC6/CTI20007882/Ada3) on 29/07/2020

Attachments: TP LOD & DOCS.pdf; LKK SURVEY REPORT & PHOTOS.pdf

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above captioned matter and your email below.

Please proceed to offer $3,780 as proposed by you.

Amount Amount Revised
Claimed
1. Cost of Repair $8.,501.97 $ 3,300.00
2. Loss of Use (8 days x $60.00) $ 480.00 $ 480.00 (8 days x $60.00)
Total | $ 8,987.97 $3,780.00
Regards,
Irene Tay
Executive

Claims Department (Motor Division)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896192 | F:(65) 62247478/62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: K FHisg Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files fransmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, eitherin
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the infended recipient, please notfify the sender immediately.
Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, January 11, 2021 12:20 PM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay @sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBJ786P (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SDY9018L (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/CTI20007882/Ada3) on 29/07/2020



Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GB] 786P (CTI) AND SDY 9018L (TP) ON 29/07 /2020

We refer to the above matter.

We seek your approval to offer repairer “LEANG AUTOMOTIVE” at $3,780.00 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Amount Revised
Claimed
1. Cost of Repair $8,501.97 $3,300.00
2. Loss of Use (8 days x $60.00) $480.00 $480.00 (8 days x $60.00)
Total | $ 8,987.97 $3,780.00

Surveyor recommended 7 days for repair + 1 Sunday = 8 days

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Irene Tay [mailto:irene.tay @sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 25 August 2020 2:46 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Admin A; Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBJ786P (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SDY9018L (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/CTI20007882/Ada3) on 29/07/2020

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed herewith our insured ‘s SAS Report as requested by you.
Regards,

Irene Tay
Executive
Claims Department (Motor Division)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896192 | F:(65) 62247478/62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: K F#iisi Taiping SG




Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, August 11, 2020 6:39 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cec: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe @lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBJ786P (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SDY9018L (TP : LKK REF
- CC6/CTI20007882/Ada3) on 29/07/2020

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SDY 9018L at M/s Leang Automotive - Kaki Bukit on a WP basis and TP repairer
proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report

Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair is not ready yet.

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jia Le and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 5792.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



