
 

       
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 02-22 @ Kaki Bukit Auto Hub, Singapore 417921 

Email: ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com      
 Tel: 67418277 Fax: 67468277  

 GST REG NUMBER: 201635107M 

 
 

Lonpac Insurance Bhd               21/8/2020 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 
The Concourse 
Singapore 199555 
     
Attn:   Motor Claims Dept       

LETTER OF DEMAND 

 

Our Ref   : GZ713G     Your Ref     :     - 

Dear Sir, 

VEHICLE  #   : GZ713G 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING : GZ713G & GBJ9759J ALONG BKE TOWARDS SLE ON 29/7/20 

 

COST OF REPAIR : S$5,550.00 (As agreed) 

LTA & GIA SEARCH : S$     28.97 

ADD GST  7%  :  S$   390.53 

LOSS OF USE  : S$   2,280.00  

    {12 work days + 5 weekends + 1 day PH + 1 day prs}x120  
   

TOTAL   : S$8,249.50 

DOLLARS:  EIGHT THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED AND NINETY-SIX ONLY. 

 

 

For your prompt payment. 

Thank you. 

 

Yours faithfully, 

Ryder Auto Pte Ltd 

____ ____ 

Chan San Choon 
Director 
DipEng, AAE MIMI, MSAE(Aust) 
 

 







 

       
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 02-22 @ Kaki Bukit Auto Hub, Singapore 417921 

Email: ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com      
 Tel: 67418277 Fax: 67468277  

 GST REG NUMBER: 201635107M 

 
 

Lonpac Insurance Bhd               21/8/2020 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 
The Concourse 
Singapore 199555 
     
Attn:   Motor Claims Dept       

TAX INVOICE 

 

Our Ref   : GZ713G     Your Ref     :     - 

Dear Sir, 

VEHICLE  #   : GZ713G 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING : GZ713G & GBJ9759J ALONG BKE TOWARDS SLE ON 29/7/20 

 

COST OF REPAIR : S$5,550.00 (As agreed) 

 

LTA & GIA SEARCH : S$     28.97 

 

ADD GST  7%  :  S$   390.53 

 

TOTAL   : S$5,969.50 

 

DOLLARS:  FIVE THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED SIXTY-NINE & CENTS 
FIFTY ONLY. 

 

For your prompt payment. 

Thank you. 

 

Yours faithfully, 

Ryder Auto Pte Ltd 

____ ____ 

Chan San Choon 
Director 
DipEng, AAE MIMI, MSAE(Aust) 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>
Sent: Saturday, 12 September 2020 1:57 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A; MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving GBJ 9759J & GZ 713G along BKE on 

29/07/2020 - Oref: 20/20/20/VC00/023503 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear Cecilia  

Please proceed as per your recommendations.  
 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Kenny Lim  
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices. 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 3 September 2020 4:21 pm 
To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving GBJ 9759J & GZ 713G along BKE on 29/07/2020 
- Oref: 20/20/20/VC00/023503 [External Confidential] 
 
Dear Kenny, 
 
Kindly ignore previous email.  
 
Mandate as follow:  
 

Lonpac Ref: 20/20/20/VC00/02350 

LKK Ref: CC4/LPC20007855/Egs3s2 
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Dear Sirs/Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We have highlighted to your good office on 04/08/2020 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

 

This is a head-to-rear collision. Liability is not in our driver’s favour. 

 

Summary to offer to third party repairer, “RYDER AUTO PTE LTD” is as follows: - 

 

 
Claimed Amount Revised Amount 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 12,491.72 $ 5,938.50 
2. Loss of Use (19days x $120.00) $ 2,280.00 $ 1,900.00 (19days x $100.00) 
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 31.00 $ 31.00 

Total $ 14,802.72 $ 7,869.50 

 

**12days recommendation for repair + 2sunday + 2PH + 1PRS + 2saturday = 19days. 

 

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 

 

The above is for your approval. 

 
 
 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. 
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
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Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Thursday, 3 September 2020 4:04 PM 
To: Su Li (LKK Auto) ; 'KENNY LIM CHING GHEE'  
Cc: Admin A ; MT_Claim_SG  
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving GBJ 9759J & GZ 713G along BKE on 29/07/2020 
- Oref: 20/20/20/VC00/023503 [External Confidential] 
 

Lonpac Ref: 20/20/20/VC00/02350 

LKK Ref: CC4/LPC20007855/Egs3s2 

 

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We have highlighted to your good office on 04/08/2020 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

 

This is a head-to-rear collision. Liability is not in our driver’s favour. 

 

Summary to offer to third party repairer, “RYDER AUTO PTE LTD” is as follows: - 

 

 
Claimed Amount Revised Amount 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 12,491.72 $ 5,938.50 
2. Loss of Use (19days x $120.00) $ 2,280.00 $ 1,900.00 (19days x $100.00) 
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 31.00 $ 31.00 

Total $ 14,802.72 $ 7,869.50 

 

**12days recommendation for repair + 2sunday + 2PH + 1PRS + 2saturday = 19days. 
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Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 

 

The above is for your approval. 

 
 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. 
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 4 August 2020 5:27 PM 
To: 'KENNY LIM CHING GHEE' <kennylim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; 
MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving GBJ 9759J & GZ 713G along BKE on 29/07/2020 
- Oref: 20/20/20/VC00/023503 [External Confidential] 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have inspected third party vehicle GZ 713G at M/s RYDER AUTO WORKSHOP PTE LTD on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed 
for a direct settlement. 
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:  

 TP estimated cost of repair 
 Preliminary advice 
 Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition 

 
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge Cecilia. 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
 
* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Su Li | Admin Support 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 1467 Email: SuLi@lkkauto.com| Fax : 6271 8802 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Branch : Blk 1007, Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-11 | S(159721) 

 

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 30 July, 2020 10:49 AM 
To: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving GBJ 9759J & GZ 713G along BKE on 29/07/2020 
- Oref: 20/20/20/VC00/023503 [External Confidential] 
 

Lonpac External - Confidential 
Dear team  
 
Please see attachments.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Kenny Lim  
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices. 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE  
Sent: Thursday, 30 July 2020 10:45 am 
To: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving GBJ 9759J & GZ 713G along BKE on 29/07/2020 - 
Oref: 20/20/20/VC00/023503 [External Confidential] 
 

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear team  
 
Please arrange for a PRS of t/p vehicle GZ 713G at Ryder Auto Workshop.  
 
Attahced herewith our Insured’s GIA report for your perusal.  
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Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Kenny Lim  
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices. 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 
From: Ryder Auto workshop  
Sent: Wednesday, 29 July 2020 4:59 pm 
To: MT_Claim_SG  
Subject: Urgent: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: Your Vehicle GBJ9759J; Our Vehicle GZ713G Accident 
involving GZ713G & GBJ9759J On 29 July2020 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Kindly find attached PRS for your necessary action. 
 
For Direct Settlement cases, we only use in-house surveyor. Kindly arrange your in-house surveyor.  
 
Thank you. 
 
Best regards 
June 
 

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
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