Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 March 2021 2:39 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: [DENY LIABILITY] MSFCIL REF: D20002975MFSH - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES
SH9180L AND SMG4227X ON 25/07/2020

Attachments: 4. MSA - Jobsheet_D20002975MFSH_TPD1.pdf; PIR - AGAINST TP.png

Dear Cecilia,

We refer to the subject matter and to the assignment.

Please find attached PIR from our Insured Driver where action taken against TPD for Careless Driving.
As such, kindly deny TP claim and submit your WP report and you may close file in your end.

Thank you.

Kind Regards,

Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877

| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3846 | Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn.
No. 195000106C

A Member of EIEEEH Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sq for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.



Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 11 March 2021 3:15 PM

To: ‘Wei Shong'

Subject: RE: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D20002975MFSH ; YOUR REF: SMG4227X
Attachments: Ol PIR.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Wei Shong,
We refer to the above matter.
Attached is a copy of PIR from Ol.

Your client has been charged for careless driving causing hurt. In view of above, we have our principal instruction to
deny liability and not able to look into this matter.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
874 74

ReERER W Spye the Earth- Print only when necessary-

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 March 2021 12:27 PM

To: Wei Shong <wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D20002975MFSH ; YOUR REF: SMG4227X

2\° REMINDER

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



