Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: claims <claims@rico60.com>
Sent: Friday, 30 October 2020 10:30 AM
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); 'Damian Lim'
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SKX6866Y REPAIR LIMIT

Dear all,

Offer accepted.

Dear Shanelle,

Kindly prepare LOD and COR to submit.
Br,

John Ong

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) [mailto:Taufikh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 30 October 2020 9:25 AM

To: 'Rico 60"

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SKX6866Y REPAIR LIMIT

Hi,

Please refer attached . COR L/S$23000, 10DAYS.
Regards

Taufikh

Lkk Auto

Get Qutlook for Android

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <taufikh@I|kkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, August 3, 2020 12:48:02 PM

To: 'Rico 60' <claims@rico60.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SKX6866Y REPAIR LIMIT

Hi,
Please take note repair limit for this car is $23,000.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto
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