
To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 20/05/2021

Your Ref. No. : DM20HO01083/JT

Our Ref. No. : CC4/EQI20007820/Dba3q2

: $ 22,679.72       

: $ 550.00            11 days

Rental (If any)      : $ 1,391.17         11 days 

: $ 7.45                

: $ 80.00              

24,708.34       

: $ 24,708.34       

:

 

1)                   : $ 24,708.34                              

                  : $

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

JOANNE LEE

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

Remarks 

Loss of Use

Final Repair Cost

(Insd Veh)
Vehicle No.

28/7/2020

GBG 4970M

SHD 6528P

Date of Accident

   (TP Veh)

100%

BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD

Others:

Final Settlement Sum 

Towing Fee

Liability
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 10 September 2020 9:44 AM
To: roger@catsmart.com.sg
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 6528P AND GBG 4970M ON 28/07/2020

Our Ref:  CC4/EQI20007820/Dba3 
 
10 SEPTEMBER 2020 
 
PETS'S KIOSK PET SALON  
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 6528P AND GBG 4970M ON 28/07/2020 
 
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED to resolve the claim against 
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
                 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate 
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 
within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial 
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will 
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.  
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jaime Tay <jaime.tay@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 5 April 2021 9:29 AM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: PRS for our client’s vehicle SHD 6528 P and your insured’s vehicle GBG 4970 M 

on 28.07.2020. // EQI REF: DM20HO01083/JT

Dear Jasper,  
 
Please proceed to settle TPD up to your recommendation of $24,708.38. 
 
Kindly let us have the Discharge Voucher and bank details of the workshop upon settlement in order for us to 
process payment. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Announcement 
 
In line with the Safe Re-opening measures, our operation remains “Business As Usual” – except most of us are on a Work-From-Home 
arrangement -reachable by phone or email or an arranged video call meeting.  

 
Our Customer Care Counter will remain closed until further notice. Any onsite customer care service, including meetings in the EQI premises 
can only be conducted on a prior agreed appointment basis. 
 
 
Regards, 

Jaime Tay 
Executive | Claims 

  

  
EQ Insurance Company Limited 
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110 

        

did 65 6496 9882 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 882 | fax 65 6223 4190 
www.eqinsurance.com.sg        
  

 

  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.        
 

 
 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 31 March 2021 5:18 pm 
To: Jaime Tay <jaime.tay@eqinsurance.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: PRS for our client’s vehicle SHD 6528 P and your insured’s vehicle GBG 4970 M on 28.07.2020. // EQI REF: 
DM20HO01083/JT 
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the subject matter. 
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It was reported that Insured driver lost control. 
 
A letter was sent out to the Insured to notify TP claim and NCD issues and no feedback received till date.   
 
Summary to offer to repairer BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD is as follows: 
 

TP CLAIMED REVISED -TO 
OFFER   

Cost of Repair (w/gst) $       53,115.26   $         22,679.72   
Loss of Income (11 days x 
$80.00) $            880.00   $              550.00  

(11 days x 
$50.00) 

Loss of Rental (11 days x 
$126.47) $         1,391.17   $           1,391.17   
Towing Fee $              80.00   $                80.00   
LTA Search   $                7.49   $                  7.49   
Proposed Total   $       55,473.92   $         24,708.38   

 
Breakdown of days is as follows: 
 

Recommended repair days  11 

Weekends / Downtime  0 

CLAIM DAYS  11 
 
For your approval and/or further instruction please. 
 
Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Jaime Tay <jaime.tay@eqinsurance.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 12 August 2020 8:32 AM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: PRS for our client’s vehicle SHD 6528 P and your insured’s vehicle GBG 4970 M on 28.07.2020. // EQI 
REF: DM20HO01083/JT 
 
Dear Mei Kwan,  
 
Please find enclosed GIA report as requested. 
 
Announcement 
 
In line with the Safe Re-opening measures, our operation remains “Business As Usual” – except most of us are on a Work-From-Home 
arrangement -reachable by phone or email or an arranged video call meeting.  

 
Our Customer Care Counter will remain closed until further notice. Any onsite customer care service, including meetings in the EQI premises 
can only be conducted on a prior agreed appointment basis. 
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Thank you. 
 
Regards, 

Jaime Tay 
Executive | Claims 

  

  
EQ Insurance Company Limited 
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110 

        

did 65 6496 9882 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 882 | fax 65 6223 4190 
www.eqinsurance.com.sg        
  

 

  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.        
 

 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: 11 August 2020 18:54 
To: Jaime Tay <jaime.tay@eqinsurance.com.sg> 
Cc: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: PRS for our client’s vehicle SHD 6528 P and your insured’s vehicle GBG 4970 M on 28.07.2020. // EQI 
REF: DM20HO01083/JT 
 
YOUR REF: DM20HO01083/JT 
LKK REF: CC4/EQI20007820/Dba3 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have inspected TP vehicle SHD 6528P on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement. 
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:  

- Estimated cost of repair 
- Preliminary advice  
 

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action. 
 
Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Jasper and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2928. 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 



1

Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Joseph Koh <joseph.koh@bifrostauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 12 April 2021 8:38 AM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Claims Dept; Joseph Koh; claims_ltm@bifrostauto.com; claims_ltv@bifrostauto.com; 

Admin A
Subject: Re: SHD 6528 P / DOA: 28.07.2020 / Your Ref(GBG 4970 M) / Finalization 

Acceptance / LOD Issuance *** LKK REF: CC4/EQI20007820/Dba3 / Final invoice & 
DV

Dear Jasper, 
 
Please find payment details below. Thank you for processing. 
  
Account Name Bifrost Auto Pte Ltd 
Account Number 0709028861 
Bank Name DBS Bank Ltd 
Bank & Branch 
Code 

Bank Code: 7171  
Branch Code: 070 

  

Joseph Koh 
Claims Department 
M: 96488228 
 
BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD 
6001 Beach Road, Golden Mile Tower, #22-01 
Singapore 199589 
 
 
 
 
On Sun, 11 Apr 2021 at 17:14, Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

  

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

  

Please be informed that EQ is moving into E-payment modes. 

  

Kindly provide the bank details as below to us for our necessary action. 
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