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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type: Company
Owner |0 B33D
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.; GBE&204P
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 25 Jun 2020
Wehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model; DY HA 3.0 MANUAL
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2015
Engine Mo.: 1KD2574006
Chassis No.: KDY2318022720
Maximum Power Qutput; -
Open Market Value: $30.407.00
Original Registration Date: 01Feb 2016
First Registration Date; 01Feb 2016
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $1,521.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Mo
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount; $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 31 Jan 2026
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10
POP Paid: £43.066.00
COE Rebate Amount: $24,114.00
Total Rebate Amount: $24,114.00 A A A ?
The information contained herein is correct as at 25 Jun 2020 b&-’ "J‘f 56‘ p J(_.r..{ .
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Celine Fana (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 26 June 2020 1:45 PM

To: Peggy Chan Pek Kay; LKK Valuation

Cc: Suzanne Tay Siew Hong; Information Security Officer
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR INDICATIVE VALUATION - GEEB204P
Dear Peggy,

The valuation of GBE 6204P is as below:
MY S35K FS: 530K

As at June 2020

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(208033)

From: Peggy Chan Pek Kay <peggychan@sif.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 26 June 2020 12:01 PM

To: Celine Fong [LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Suzanne Tay Siew Hong <suzannetay@sif.com.sg>; Information Security Officer <secadmin@sif.com.sg>
Subject: REQUEST FOR INDICATIVE VALUATION - GBEG204P

Dear Celine,

Please advise us on the indicative valuation as we have interested buyers asking for quotes on the vehicles. Thank
you.

Best Regards,

Peggy Chan

Assistant Manager

Credit Collection Department

DID: 63097184

Website: www.sif.com.sg

Company Registration No. 196400348D
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This email and any files transmitted with it ("the Email") are confidential and are intended solely for the named addressee. If you are not the
intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute, copy or use the Email far any purpose or disclose the contents to any person. If you
have received the Email in error, please immediately delete it and any record of it from your system and netify the sender by return email. Thank
You.

From: Peggy Chan Pek Kay

Sent: 25 June 2020 12:58 PM

To: 'Celine Fong (LEKAuto)'; 'LKK Valuation'

Cc: Suzanne Tay Siew Hong; Information Security Officer

Subject: REQUEST FOR INDICATIVE VALUATION - GBEG6204P

Importance: High

Dear Celine,

Refer to Sophia's email dated 13 Apr 2020,

Flease advise us on the indicative valuation for the subject vehicle.

We will inform you to prepare the formal valuation once we have found a confirmed buyer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Peggy Chan

Assistant Manager

Credit Collection Department
DID: 63097184

Website: www.sif.com.sg
Company Registration No. 196400348D
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This email and any files transmitted with it ("the Email") are confidential and are intended solely for the named addressee. If you are not the
intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute, copy or use the Email for any purpose or disclose the contents to any parson, If you

have received the Email in errer, please immediately delete it and any record of it from your system and notify the sender by return email. Thank
you.

From: Sophia Soh Hui Ping

Sent: 13 April 2020 11:26 AM

To: valuation@lkkauto.com; celi

Subject: REQUEST FOR INDICATIVE VALUATION

Hi Celine,



Please assist to provide an indicative valuation for the attach vehicle,
We will follow up with a formal valuation once we found a confirmed buyer.

Password will be provided in a separate email.

Best Regards,

Sophia 5oh

Senior Associate

Credit Collection Department
DID: 62050306

Website: www.sif.com.sg
Company Registration No, 196400348D
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This email and any files transmitted with it {"the Email") are confidential and are intended solely for the named addressee. If
you are not the intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute, copy or use the Email for any purpose or disclose the
contents to any person. If you have received the Email in error, please immediately delete it and any record of it from your
system and notify the sender by return email. Thank you.



Celine ang (LKKAuto)

From: Sophia Soh Hui Ping <sophiasch@sif.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 13 April 2020 11:26 AM

To: LKK Valuation; Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Subject: REQUEST FOR INDICATIVE VALUATION
Attachments: Log Card.zip

Hi Celine,

Please assist to provide an indicative valuation for the attach vehicle,
We will follow up with a formal valuation once we found a confirmed buyer.
Password will be provided in a separate email.

Best Regards,

Sophia Soh

Senior Associate

Credit Collection Department
DID: 63050396

Website: www.sif.com.sg
Company Registration No. 196400348D
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This emnail and any files transmitted with it ("the Email") are confidential and are intended solely for the named addressee. If
you are not the intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute, copy or use the Email for any purpose or disclose the
contents to any person. If you have received the Email in error, please immediately delete it and any record of it from your
system and notify the sender by return email. Thank you.



