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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 August 2020 2:21 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA7253L & SLM1451P ON 9.5.2019 [External General]

Attachments: LKKInvoice1.pdf; LKKAdjustment1a.pdf; LKKInspection.pdf

Dear Greald, 

 

Enclosed survey report 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6271-0351 | email:  sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 7 August 2020 9:14 AM 

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; 'Natalie Ng' <natalie_ng@rssolomon.com> 

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA7253L & SLM1451P ON 9.5.2019 [External General] 

 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

Thank you for the email. 

 

Dear Denise, 

 

Kinldy assist. 
 

Best Regards, 

Summer Lee | Admin 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 

1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  

Sent: Friday, 7 August, 2020 8:14 AM 

To: 'Natalie Ng' <natalie_ng@rssolomon.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; 'assignments@lkkauto.com' <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA7253L & SLM1451P ON 9.5.2019 [External General] 

 

Lonpac External - General 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 
Our Ref        : 19/19/19/VC05/021781 
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Your Ref      : RSS/1905-7243(KW)(PD) 
 

Dear Natalie, 
 

Your fax of 5 August 2020 refers. 
 

We are seeking verifications with our surveyor that conduct the pre-repair survey 
on the repair costs submitted to us. 
 

Please bear with us while we remind our surveyor to expedite. 
 

In the meantime ,please hold hands.  
 
 

 
Aside to LKK – Attn : Summer 

                                Kindly arrange to provide us the report 
 
 

Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 

 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 

 


