Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, August 21, 2020 4:26 PM

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Finalize SLK 3396M

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: Green category

Sun Pin

Ok confirm Part By Part $864.23/2 days

Thanks & Best Regards
S.T.Sim

Manager

Accident Reporting Center
60 Jalan Lam Huat
#04-35/36 Carros Centre
Singapore 737869

H/P: 65-97422188

LION CITY RENTALS PTE

On Thu, Aug 20, 2020 at 4:48 PM Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Mr Sim,

Kindly refer the finalize amount $864.23. Repair day 2 days. (P/P, before gst).

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pill| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants
Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: _Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
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