Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 July, 2020 3:21 PM

To: TeamAutoPro North; 'assignments’; Admin A

Cc: TeamAutoPro North

Subject: RE: FW: SNM20D202584/GBF2362L/TAYHP / FW: 2 DAYS NOTICE : GBJ 9049 A (Our

Ref) and GBF 2362 L (Your Ref) Dated 24TH JULY 2020

Dear Sir,
Please get your surveyor to liaise with TEAM AUTOPRO to conduct survey.
Regards,

Irene Tay
Executive
Claims Department (Motor Division)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896192 | F:(65) 62247478/62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: K F¥iis Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 28, 2020 10:30 AM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: Re: FW: SNM20D202584/GBF2362L/TAYHP / FW: 2 DAYS NOTICE : GBJ 9049 A (Our Ref) and GBF 2362 L
(Your Ref) Dated 24TH JULY 2020

Dear Irene,

Yes okay LKK Autoconsultant.
Thank you!

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Note: Dear all, do note that Team AutoPro will be subjected to GST filing within the next 2
months. We would appreciate your kind prioritization on pending cases to avoid revision on final
payment. Thank you and do let us know if you have further query.

Peach Ang



Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

On Tue, Jul 28, 2020 at 10:05 AM Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com> wrote:

LKK can?

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 28, 2020 9:45 AM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: Re: FW: SNM20D202584/GBF2362L/TAYHP / FW: 2 DAYS NOTICE : GBJ 9049 A (Our Ref) and GBF 2362 L
(Your Ref) Dated 24TH JULY 2020

Dear Irene,

So only Formteam?

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his
personal injuries.*

Note: Dear all, do note that Team AutoPro will be subjected to GST filing within the next 2
months. We would appreciate your kind prioritization on pending cases to avoid revision on final
payment. Thank you and do let us know if you have further query.

Peach Ang



Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

On Tue, Jul 28, 2020 at 8:33 AM Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Enclosed herewith the list of surveyor for your attention.

Regards,

Irene Tay
Executive

Claims Department (Motor Division)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: (65) 63896192 | F:(65) 62247478/62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: & -F¥is Taiping SG




Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient,
please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, July 27, 2020 9:42 AM

To: teamautopl@gmail.com; Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: O/R: SNM20D202584/GBF2362L/TAYHP / FW: 2 DAYS NOTICE : GBJ 9049 A (Our Ref) and GBF 2362 L
(Your Ref) Dated 24TH JULY 2020

Dear Irene,

Please conduct PRS for GBJ9049A. (OUR INSURED HAS YET TO FILED SAS REPORT)

Note: officer in charge — Irene Tay 63896192.

*** Kindly quote our reference number when replying.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as
delay is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thank you

Chong Boon Sen

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
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DID: (65) 63896116 | F: (65) 62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: X4 Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient,
please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, July 24, 2020 7:37 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: 2 DAYS NOTICE : GBJ 9049 A (Our Ref) and GBF 2362 L (Your Ref) Dated 24TH JULY 2020

Dear Sir/Madam,
Road Traffic Accident Involving GBJ 9049 A (Our Ref) and GBF 2362 L (Your Ref)
Dated 24™ JULY 2020, Time around 1650HRS

@ SEMBAWANG ROAD

We represent our client; CAR CONCEPT LEASING, to notify you of the aforesaid road traffic accident involving
our client’s vehicle registration number: GBJ 9049 A and your insured’s vehicle registration number: GBF 2362 L.

enclosed herewith a copy of our 2 Days Notice Letter and the relevant Singapore Accident Statement filed for your
reference.

For efficiency purpose, we are agreeable with the appointment of LKK AUTOCONSULTANTS as
the SJE for subject claim. Please let us know within 2 working days from today your agreeing to the above otherwise
kindly send us your list of at least ten (10) motor surveyors, via email to the following personnel:-

Contact Person Eric Lee 8269 9999




Email Address teamautopl@gmail.com

Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his
personal injuries.*

Note: Dear all, do note that Team AutoPro will be subjected to GST filing within the next 2
months. We would appreciate your kind prioritization on pending cases to avoid revision on final
payment. Thank you and do let us know if you have further query.

Peach Ang

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722



