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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Su Li (LKK Auto)
Sent: 21 December 2020 8:39 AM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SDK8363U (SNM20D202657C02/3(at) and 

SHD 1076J (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI20007791/ks3) on 28/07/2020 - HIT & RUN

 
Hi, 
 
FYNA, our ref CC3/CTI20007791/T1ks3 
 
 
 
"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 
 
* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
                                                                
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Su Li | Admin Support 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 1467 Email: SuLi@lkkauto.com| Fax : 6271 8802 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Branch : Blk 1007, Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-11 | S(159721) 

 
From: Vitesse Insurance [mailto:sales@vitesseinsurance.com]  
Sent: Friday, 18 December 2020 8:02 PM 
To: PCCT 
Cc: Su Li (LKK Auto) 
Subject: Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SDK8363U (SNM20D202657C02/3(at) and SHD 1076J (TP : LKK REF - 
CC3/CTI20007791/ks3) on 28/07/2020 - HIT & RUN 
 
Hi su li,  
 
Mr Patrick will not be doing pte settlement. 
 
Cheers 
 
Chris 

On Thu, 17 Dec 2020, 11:00 am Vitesse Insurance, <sales@vitesseinsurance.com> wrote: 

hi Mr Patrick, pls kindly advise. 
 
cheers 
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chris 

Vitesse  

7030 Ang Mo Kio Ave 5 

# 05-34 Northstar @ AMK 

Singapore 569880 
  
Tel    :  65533 468 (Main Line) 

Fax   :  65533 068 

Email:   sales@vitesseinsurance.com 

Website : www.vitesseinsurance.com 
Whatsapp : https://wa.me/6591695050 
___________________________________________________________________________________ 
  
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by Vitesse except where provided 
for in a written agreement between you and Vitesse. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either 
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender 
immediately. 
___________________________________________________________________________________  
Please consider the environment before printing this email    

 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Date: Thu, Dec 17, 2020 at 10:29 AM 
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SDK8363U (SNM20D202657C02/3(at) and SHD 1076J 
(TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI20007791/ks3) on 28/07/2020 - HIT & RUN 
To: Vitesse Insurance <sales@vitesseinsurance.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
 

Dear Chris, 

  

As spoken, please let us know the decision by 21/12/2020. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 
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Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)  
Sent: 9 November 2020 5:11 PM 
To: Vitesse Insurance <sales@vitesseinsurance.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; PCCT <ctcheongp@yahoo.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SDK8363U (SNM20D202657C02/3(at) and SHD 1076J 
(TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI20007791/ks3) on 28/07/2020 - HIT & RUN 

  

Dear Chris, 

  

We refer to the above matter and our e-mail dated 16/10/2020. 

  

Since we didn’t hear from you to-date, we will proceed to submit the relevant documents to China Taiping 
Insurance accordingly. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

  

Best Regards, 


