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RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving SLS2351G &
GBJ8012L on 26/06/2020 - Oref: 19/20/20/VC200/023429 [External Confidential]

KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>
Wed 12/16/2020 2:00 PM
To:  Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Lonpac External - Confidential
 
Dear Asher
 
Please proceed as per your recommendations.
 
Thank you.
 
Best Regards
 
Kenny Lim
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 16 December 2020 11:21 am 
To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: Re: [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving SLS2351G & GBJ8012L on
26/06/2020 - Oref: 19/20/20/VC200/023429 [External Confiden�al]
 
Hi Kenny,
 
We refer to the email dated 05/10/2020.
 
Third party chasing for offer / se�lement.
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruc�on if any.
 
Thank You.
Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler

https://www.lonpac.com.sg/


1/7/2021 Mail - Asher Sng (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/search/id/AAQkAGVlNDlkMTdjLTM3MDgtNDY5ZC1hZTdkLWQ3ZDMyNTE0MGFhMgAQABLuNW78f0UVkr1CqWN… 2/5

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed. 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, October 5, 2020 11:33 AM 
To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE  
Cc: MT_Claim_SG  
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving SLS2351G & GBJ8012L on
26/06/2020 - Oref: 19/20/20/VC200/023429 [External Confiden�al]

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 11/06/2019 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

The accident occurred when our insured reversed into the main road and hit third party vehicle.

Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability.

Summary to offer to repairer ETHOZ GROUP LTD is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 8,855.89 $ 3,691.50

2. Loss of Use (6days x $120) $ 720.00 $ 600.00 (6days x $100)

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 2.00 $ 2.00

Total $ 9,577.89 $ 4,293.50

**4 days recommendation for repair.

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
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Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

 

** We have check with insured repairer S & H Motor and they inform that the liability not in our insured favor and
they not pursing the claim.

The above is for your approval please.

 
 
Thank You.
Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed. 

 

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE  
Sent: Wednesday, July 29, 2020 1:32 PM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)  
Cc: Admin A ; MT_Claim_SG ; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving SLS2351G & GBJ8012L on 26/06/2020 - Oref:
19/20/20/VC200/023429 [External Confiden�al]
Lonpac External - Confiden�al
Dear Asher
For the above ma�er, our Insured is also claiming against the third party.
In this instance, we appreciate if you can engage our Insured to verify on liability before deciding on Direct
Se�lement.
Thank you.
Best Regards
Kenny Lim
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are commi�ed to ac�ng professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
prac�ces.
Lonpac External - Confiden�al data is for use by authorised external par�es only.

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
https://www.lonpac.com.sg/
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Tuesday, 28 July 2020 5:31 pm 
To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE  
Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) ; Admin A ; MT_Claim_SG  
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving SLS2351G & GBJ8012L on 26/06/2020 - Oref:
19/20/20/VC200/023429 [External Confiden�al]
YOUR REF: 19/20/20/VC200/023429
LKK REF: CC4/LPC20007770/Uea3
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above ma�er.
We had inspected TP vehicle GBJ 8012L on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for direct se�lement.
Enclosed for your perusal is:
· TP es�mated cost of repair
· Preliminary advice
Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.
Thank you.
Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 28 July, 2020 11:18 AM 
To: 'KENNY LIM CHING GHEE' <kennylim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving SLS2351G & GBJ8012L on 26/06/2020 - Oref:
19/20/20/VC200/023429 [External Confiden�al]
Dear Sir/Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.
Best Regards,
Summer Lee | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi
Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 28 July, 2020 11:09 AM 
To: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving SLS2351G & GBJ8012L on 26/06/2020 - Oref:
19/20/20/VC200/023429 [External Confiden�al]
Lonpac External - Confiden�al
Dear team
Please arrange for a PRS of T/P vehicle GBJ8012L at Ethoz (Tempines).
At the same �me, appreciate if you can assess liablilty as well.
Thnak you.
Best Regards
Kenny Lim
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
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DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are commi�ed to ac�ng professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
prac�ces.
Lonpac External - Confiden�al data is for use by authorised external par�es only.
From: Ng Boon Kai <BoonKai.Ng@ethozgroup.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 28 July 2020 10:05 am 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Jimmy Goh <jimmy.gohkl@ethozgroup.com>; Rakeswaran Anand <rakes.anand@ethozgroup.com> 
Subject: Survey for vehicle No : GBJ-8012-L TP Claim
Hi Motor Claims, 

Appreciate if you could arrange survey for the above men�oned vehicle. (Vehicle in workshop Tampines)
Your insured :SLS-2351-G
DOA : 26/06/2020
Thank you,
Regards,
Boon Kai
Execu�ve
Motor Claims Opera�on

ETHOZ GROUP LTD 
22 Tampines Street 92 Singapore 528876 
DID: 6654 7617 | Fax: 6654 7648 
Website: www.ethozgroup.com

Disclaimer: This message may contain confiden�al informa�on intended only for the use of the addressee named
above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby no�fied that any use, dissemina�on,
distribu�on or reproduc�on of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by mistake, please no�fy
the sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before opening any a�achment as
ETHOZ Group does not guarantee the integrity of this email or a�ached files has been maintained nor this
communica�on is free of viruses, intercep�ons or interference. Any views expressed in this message are those of
the individual sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of ETHOZ Group. ETHOZ Group shall not be
responsible nor liable for the improper and incomplete transmission of the informa�on contained in this
communica�on nor for any delay in its receipt or damage to your system.
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