Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd <sinyewhup@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, October 2, 2020 2:47 PM

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: GBG3193X

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: Green category

Yes, confirmed. COR $17,500.00 before excess and GST. 14 working days.
Best Regards,

Edwin Yap
SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD

T:+65 67600819
F:+65 67690221

Virus-free. www.avg.com

On Fri, Oct 2, 2020 at 10:48 AM Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Edwin,

Kindly refer the finalize amount $17,500. Repair day 14 days. (L/S, before gst).
Please confirm the COR by reply email.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pill| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: _Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




