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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 10 September 2020 12:46 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: Re: YOUR REF: SMS 8374P (OUR REF: CC6/EQI20007641/Ags3) *** ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING PC 7629K & SMS 8374P ON 22/07/2020 ***

Your Ref: CC6/EQI20007641/Ags3 (PC7629K) 
Our Ref: SMS8374P 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
We refer to below, we accept the offer at a global sum of $4,600.00. 
Please kindly let us have your DV soonest. 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Ms Wong 
MG SOLUTION PTE LTD 
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre 
#02-03B Singapore 415933 
Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376 
 
 
 
On Thu, Sep 10, 2020 at 11:58 AM Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Su, 

We are pleased to offer G/S $4600.00 (all-in). 

Kindly confirm acceptance. 

Thanks  

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our 
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the 
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer 
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters. 

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for 
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made 
payment on the settlement sum.” 


