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Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Irene Tan <motor@iaconsultingsg.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 December 2020 12:33 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; candy

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE7301R AND SHA8372Z ALONG TAMPINES AVE 5 TWDS 

SIMEI ST 3 BEFORE CHANGI GENERAL HOSPITAL ON 20.07.2020 *** LKK REF : 

CC4/FCI20007603/Era3q2

Attachments: BRWE86F389ACE7E_000713.pdf

Dear Jaslin, 

 

attached signed DV as requested. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Regards, 

Irene Tan 

 

 

 

---- On Wed, 02 Dec 2020 11:46:48 +0800 Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> wrote -

--- 

 

 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

Thank you for acceptance. 

  

Please duly sign the Discharge Receipt enclosed and return to us(LKK) for our necessary action. 

  
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Irene Tan <motor@iaconsultingsg.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 2 December 2020 11:29 AM 

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; candy <candy@iaconsultingsg.com> 

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE7301R AND SHA8372Z ALONG TAMPINES AVE 5 TWDS SIMEI ST 

3 BEFORE CHANGI GENERAL HOSPITAL ON 20.07.2020 *** LKK REF : CC4/FCI20007603/Era3q2 

  
Dear Jaslin, 
  
We thank you for your email dated 30 November 2020. 
  
We are instructed to accept your offer of S$841.61 on condition that the payment must be made payable to M/s Triple-T 
Automobile and received by us within 14 days from date hereof. 
  
We undertake to return your discharge voucher duly executed. 
  
Regards, 
Irene Tan 

  

  

  

---- On Mon, 30 Nov 2020 15:19:43 +0800 Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> wrote -

--- 

  

  

Your Ref: SJE 7301R 

LKK Ref: 

CC4/FCI20007603/Era3q2                                                                            Without 

Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 8372Z AND SJE 7301R ON 20.07.2020 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We propose settlement as follows: - 

  

1. Cost of Repair $ 714.16 

2. Loss of Use ( 2 days x $60.00) $ 120.00    

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 7.45        

Total $ 841.61 
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Please confirm acceptance. 
  
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

 


