
To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 13/01/2021

Your Ref. No. : DM20HO01020/SG

Our Ref. No. : CC4/EQI20007543/Upa3q2

: $ 3,216.63         

: $ 240.00            4 days

Rental (If any)      : $ days 

: $ 7.45                

: $

3,464.08         

: $ 3,464.08         

:

 

1)                   : $ 3,464.08                                

                  : $

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

JOANNE LEE

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

Remarks 

Loss of Use

Final Repair Cost

(Insd Veh)
Vehicle No.

28/3/2020

SLM 815E

SLD 299S

Date of Accident

   (TP Veh)

100%

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

Others:

Final Settlement Sum 

Liability



1

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 23 December 2020 5:07 PM
To: Jen Lim; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Tommy Woon Wui Tew; Jessica Harry Shastri; Ronald Yap; Admin A
Subject: RE: EQ - SLD299S Your ref: SLM815E LOD DOA: 28/03/2020 (MAZDA) *** LKK REF: 

CC4/EQI20007543/Upa3
Attachments: 1320_001.pdf

From: Jen Lim <jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 23 December, 2020 3:18 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Tommy Woon Wui Tew <tommy.woon@eurokars.com.sg>; Jessica Harry Shastri 
<jessica.shastri@eurokars.com.sg>; Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: EQ - SLD299S Your ref: SLM815E LOD DOA: 28/03/2020 (MAZDA) 
 
Dear Claim Admin, 
 
The repairs have been completed for SLD299S. We submit the following claims with supporting documents for your 
perusal:- 
 

1) Invoice No. 30076694 $3,216.63 
2) Loss of Use (4 days X $80.00) $320.00 
3) LTA/GIA Search Fees $7.45 
4) Letter of Authorization  
5) Discharge Voucher  

Please pay $3,224.08 to Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd,  
$320.00 to Li Zhong Cheng       

$3,544.08 

 
We look forward to receiving your offer/Discharge Voucher soon.  
Thank you. 
 
Best regards, 
Jen 



28 03







 
Our Ref: CC4/EQI20007543/Upa3 
 
31 Aug 2020 
 
DREAM LEASING PTE LTD 
155 Kaki Bukit Avenue 1 
#02-01 Shun Li Industiral Park 
Singapore 416012 
Attn: The Management 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLM 815E(EQ) AND SLD 299S ALONG SIMS AVE ON 
28/03/2020 
 
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed 
by your motor insurer, EQ Insurance Company Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your 
policy. 
 
We have received a claim from SLD299S against your insurance policy. 
  
Based on the accident report and all the available information on hand, we are of the view that 
liability is not in your driver’s favour as your driver reversed and collided on third party parked 
vehicle. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, 
please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to 
this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed 
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
“Please note EQ Insurance reserves all rights to seek recovery if the Insured and/or Authorized 
Driver is later found to be in breach of policy terms and conditions.” 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 
 
 
CHEW HSIAO TONG  
Case Handler 
DID:  6742 3197 
FAX: 6741 4108 
EMAIL: chewht@lkkauto.com 
 
 
c.c. EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED 
            (Motor Claims Dept) 
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