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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: twinauto@singnet.com.sg

Sent: Friday, 2 October 2020 5:37 PM

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GBF6310K - DOA: 23.06.20 (photos of after paint)

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Hi  

 

Acceptance amount at $1900.00 (L/sump) , 3days. 

 

Thank you 

Regards 

 

Siong Lee Motor 

Tel: 6457 0410 

 

 

On Fri Sep 25 2020 10:03:13 GMT+0800 (Singapore Standard Time) Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) 

<sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

---------- Original Message ---------- 
Hi Sir, 

  

Kindly refer the finalize amount $1,900. Repair day 3 days. (L/S, before gst). 

  

Please confirm the COR by reply email. 
  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Oi Sun Pin 

| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
  

LKK Auto Consultants 
  

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com 
| fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

  

  

  

From: 

twinauto@singnet.com.sg [mailto:twinauto@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, August 19, 2020 5:33 PM 

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: GBF6310K - DOA: 23.06.20 (photos of after paint) 

  

Hi  

 

Kindly find the attachment and finalise. 



2

  

Thank you 

Regards 

  

Siong Lee Motor 

Tel: 6457 0410 

  

  

 


