
To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 08/09/2020

Your Ref. No. : CC3/EQI20007499/Qpa3s2

Our Ref. No. : DMCTHQ20-000060

: $ 2,350.00          

: $ days

Rental (If any)      : $ 545.70             5 days 

: $ 7.00                 

: $

2,902.70          

: $ 2,900.00          

:

 

1)                   : $ 2,900.00                         

                  : $

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

100%

  SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD

Others:

Final Settlement Sum 

Liability

Vehicle No.

17/7/2020

SMG 2397B

SHB 1679E

Date of Accident

    (TP Veh)

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

Remarks 

Loss of Income

Final Repair Cost

(Insd Veh)

NUR SHAQILAH

     (GLOBAL SUM)
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 2 September 2020 1:45 PM
To: CS A Team; Admin A
Subject: LOD   Re: Accident on 17/7/2020 involving SHB 1679E & SMG 2397B (EQ's insured0 

Our Ref: TAX/07/20/2033/lg 
Attachments: 4354_001.pdf

Dear All, 
 
We quantify our own losses as follows:-  
 

Cost of Repair $2,350.00            

Loss of Rental $654.84  ( 6 days x $109.14  ) 

LTA Search Fee $7.00            

Total $3,011.84            
 
We enclose the following documents:  

1)    Repair invoice  
2)    Proof of rental rate 
3)    police/GIA reports  
4)    Accident vehicle laid-up report 
5)    LTA search 
6)    Hirer’s letter of authorisation  

 
Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks. 
 
Regards 
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548) 
Claims Department 
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd   

 
 





SHB 1679E

SMG 2397B
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 22 July 2020 2:57 PM
To: REDUWANABUBAKAR@GMAIL.COM
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG 2397B(AIG) AND SHB 1679E AT/ALONG PUNGGOL 

DRIVE CAPRARK (BLK 619C) ON 17/07/2020

22 July 2020                                                                       
                                                                
Mr Muhammad Reduwan Bin Abu Bakar                                                              [By Email Only] 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: SMG2397B 
Our Ref: CC3/EQI20007499/Qpa3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMG 2397B(AIG) AND SHB 1679E AT/ALONG PUNGGOL DRIVE CAPRARK (BLK 619C) ON 
17/07/2020 
 
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, EQ Insurance Company Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
 
We have received a claim from SHB1679E against your insurance policy. 
                 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is not in your driver’s favour as your vehicle was turning 
out from car park and collided with third party who was driving straight. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for 
an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to this Third Party 
claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will 
be protected. 
 
“Please note EQ Insurance reserves all rights to seek recovery if the Insured and/or Authorized Driver is later 
found to be in breach of policy terms and conditions.” 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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