Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 9 March 2021 12:29 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team
Subject: FW: Accident repair for SKL1688R

From: Kevin Leong

Sent: Tuesday, 9 March 2021 12:28:58 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Tio Jia Hao

Subject: Re: Accident repair for SKL1688R

Hi Rasul.
Good morning.

Thank you for the background of the matter.

May | check with you if this information has been made available communicated to the insured?
And if has not been, can we do so?

For your comment.

Thank you.
Kevin

Sent from my Android Mobile

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 9, 2021, 11:42 AM

To: Kevin Leong

Cc: Tio Jia Hao

Subject: RE: Accident repair for SKL1688R

Hi Kevin,

I’'ve spoken to your ex-colleague Richard regarding about this vehicle. The vehicle sustained serious damage on the
front portion mainly on chassis frame.

Apart from that, the interior surrounding of the engine compartment was badly damage as well. The undercarriage
parts, Air-bag, roof- top, front portion, were also sustained

serious damage. Richard did spoke to me that the chassis frame cost more than $ 350K in order to replaced it. Fyi,
the repair limit for this vehicle is only $ 153,144, It’s already

uneconomical to repair.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.



Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Kevin Leong [mailto:kevinleong@eurosportsauto.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 9 March, 2021 9:42 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Tio Jia Hao

Subject: RE: Accident repair for SKL1688R

Importance: High

Dear Rasul.
Good morning.

We have a request from the insured for a form of written communication that the repair for this vehicle is
beyond economical repair.

Could you share the background of this case with us so that we could understand better and see how to
assist the insured with this?

Please drop me a line as soon as you can @ 92218911.

Thank you.
Kevin

From: Kevin Leong

Sent: Monday, 4 January 2021 5:38 pm

To: 'Rasul (LKKAuto)' <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Loh Khan Wei <khanwei@eurosportsauto.com.sg>; Tio Jia Hao <jiahao@eurosportsauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Accident repair for SKL1688R

Dear Rasul.
Good evening.

We refer to our last correspondence dated 22" July 2020.

May we follow up on this case?

What is the status or documents that are pending for us to close this outstanding case?
Can we drop you at line tomorrow at 10am to speak about this matter?

Appreciate your assistance in the matter.

Thank you.

Kevin
O/B Richard

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@|kkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 22 July 2020 4:47 pm
To: Richard Harjanto <richardharjanto@eurosportsauto.com.sg>




Cc: SF Eyu <sfeyu@eurosportsauto.com.sg>; Loh Khan Wei <khanwei@eurosportsauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Accident repair for SKL1688R

Hi Richard,
Noted with thanks

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Richard Harjanto [mailto:richardharjanto@eurosportsauto.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 22 July, 2020 4:48 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: SF Eyu; Loh Khan Wei

Subject: Accident repair for SKL1688R

Hello Rasul,

The car SKL1688R has sustained serious damage to the main chassis.

To repair this, we have to order the whole car body shell like the picture as shown, together with
many other parts.

And the parts cost alone would be more that $350,000.

This car is deemed not economical to repair, thus we recommend for a total loss.






Thank you and,

Best regards,
Richard Harjanto

Lamborghini Singapore
EuroSports Auto Pte Ltd
Richard Harjanto

Service Advisor

24 Leng Kee Road #01-03

Singapore 159096

Phone: +65 6882 0865

Mobile: +65 9799 9593

Email: richardharjanto@eurosportsauto.com.sg
Web: www.lamborghini-singapore.com

Web: www.eurosportsglobal.com

The contents of this e-mail, and any attachments, are confidential and intended only for the person(s) to whom they are addressed. If you have received the email by
mistake please notify the sender immediately and delete it from your computer system. Do not copy or distribute it or disclose its contents to any person. Any improper
use of the contents of this email will be prosecuted by law in compliance with the laws in the matter of data protection as well as in order to protect the right of
confidentiality of correspondence.
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