Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 29 July 2020 8:48 AM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: GBD8856A - After Paint Photo

From: Accord Auto(Claims) [mailto:claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 28 July, 2020 5:16 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: GBD8856A - After Paint Photo

Dear Kenneth,

We have confirmed acceptance.
COR: $995.79 (before gst)
No of Day: 2 Day

Thank you.

Kind regards,

Jacqueline

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A
#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point
Singapore 568047

Mobile : (65) 9740 0999

Tel  : (65) 6481 9517
Fax : (65) 6481 9516

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view, disseminate, use or

copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system. Thank you.

On Tue, 28 Jul 2020 at 16:28, Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Final repair cost $995.79, 2days, please check and confirm. Kenneth

From: Accord Auto(Claims) <claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 28 July 2020 12:55 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: GBD8856A - After Paint Photo

Dear Kenneth,

Encl herewith the after paint photo for your reference.
Please finalise the cost of repair asap.



Thank you.

Kind regards,

Jacqueline

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A
#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point
Singapore 568047

Mobile : (65) 9740 0999
Tel  : (65) 6481 9517
Fax : (65) 6481 9516

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view, disseminate, use
or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system. Thank you.



