Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 9 November 2020 3:42 PM
To: TG Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Finalisation of SLH 939H

Dear Mr Lim,

Just update memo.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 9 November 2020 3:40 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Finalisation of SLH 939H

Hi Veron,

No change in the marking of estimates.
Only difference is the MV is increased by 1k, thus making NV 1k up as well.
Therefore my recommended COR is $5550.00 with 8 repair days.

| tried keying the amount in the views but didn’t see any safe or close button.
Do | hv to inform the IT dept of the change?

Regards,
TG Lim | Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: TeowGuan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 9 November, 2020 3:25 PM
To: TG Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Finalisation of SLH 939H

Dear Mr Lim,

Just update memo.



Marking follow the previous mark estimate?

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@|kkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 9 November 2020 3:18 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Finalisation of SLH 939H

Hi Veron,

Team Autopro had just confirmed my recommended COR of $5550.00 with 8 repair days.
As for the increased COR, | have already seek Bryan’s approval.
| cannot key in the amount in the views. Should | ask IT to assist to key in or you can do it.

Thank you very much.

Regards,
TG Lim | Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: TeowGuan@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




