Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: ngs motorsport <ngsmotorsportpteltd@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 14 August 2020 11:35 AM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: LOD For Our Insured Veh SGL5591G *** LKK REF:CC4/FWD20007379/Kba3
Attachments: DV.pdf

Dear Mr Jasper Chua,

Attached herewith our Release Voucher completed duly signed for your attention.

Best Regards,

Evelyn Ng
DID HP 9695 5547

NGS MOTORSPORT PTE LTD
Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2a
#02-01 AMK AutoPoint
Singapore 568047

On Fri, Aug 14, 2020 at 9:32 AM Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the matter above

We are offering based on your LOD, settlement amount at $2,667.45

Kindly confirm acceptance by duly sign the DV enclosed and return document to us (LKK) for our
necessary action.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.



In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ngs motorsport <ngsmotorsportpteltd@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 24 July, 2020 9:49 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: LOD For Our Insured Veh SGL5591G

Dear Sir/Madam,

RE: ACCIDENT ON 13/07/2020 @18:05HRS
ALONG SEMBAWANG ROAD TOWARDS YISHUN
INVOLVING VEH NO SGL5591G & SCX9999Y

We understand that you are the insurer of _SCX9999Y  vehicle.

I/We wish to inform you that my/our vehicle SGL5591G have been completed repairs to my/our
satisfaction by M/s NGS Motorsport Pte Litd . [/We therefore propose to claim from you as follow:-

a) Cost of Repair $2300.00
b) LOU 6days @$60.00 $ 360.00(Include Sunday)
¢) LTA Search $ 745

$2667.45

A copy each of the following supporting documents is attached

a) Authorise to act
b) Cert of insurance
¢) Our bill M/S NGS MotorSport Pte Ltd

d) LTA Search



e) SGL5591G SAS Report

f) Driver Contract

Your early reply to the above claims would therefore be much appreciated.

Your faithfully,

Evelyn Ng

DID HP 9695 5547

NGS MOTORSPORT PTE LTD
Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2a
#02-01 AMK AutoPoint

Singapore 568047



