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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Alvin Yeo <askyeo@gmail.com>
Sent: 28 July 2020 5:04 PM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH6897E & SMJ2529Y ALONG/AT PARALLEL PARKING 

ALONG TRAS STREET ON 12/07/2020
Attachments: IMG_5682.jpg; IMG_5680.jpg

Hi Khanchna,  
 
As requested, I managed to get the photo of the car taken on 24 Jul 2020. For your perusal please.  
I would like to share that Tras Street is all parallel parking lots. On that day, there is an empty lot in between 2 cars. SMJ 
2529 J is in front. The car for parking into a lot is moving at a very slow speed. After the car has gotten into the lot, step 
2 is to move forward and step 3 is to adjust the steering wheel and move backward to park within the lot.  
At step 2, when the car is moving forward, the car is only able to move at about 5-8km/h, very slow and very narrow 
space. The front of the car bumper just "kiss" the front car rear bumper. When we went down to check, there wasn't 
any dent. Because if the car was moving forward too fast and bent on the front car too hard, there would be a deep 
dent. The lad owner agrees there isn't any dent. But she then started talking about the paint work. I have explained to 
her that there is no paint stuck on any part of my car plate. And not caused by me. As we were late for the dinner 
appointment, so I gave the male driver my mobile number and thinking after the lady checked with the father and 
called me back, I am willing to "paynow" them $30 to $50 to settle the matter. As I don't have their mobile number, I 
just had to wait for their call, But they waited till 13 Jul evening then called me. I was working at that hour and texted 
my agent (Mr Richard Hue) to assist me to contact their insurance agent from INCOME. First, they say they wanted to 
settle by signing a no-claim settlement form, later they told Richard they have changed their mind and wanted to file a 
claim for the report. 
 
I didn't have any video or the accident scene photographs because I found there is no damage to both cars.  
I am checking with my family members who were with me that evening as we were attending a dinner.  
If I have any, I will let you know and will be happy to send to you.  
 
Thank you 
 
 
 
 
On Tue, 28 Jul 2020 at 15:42, Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Our Ref: CC4/AIG20007376/Kka3 

  

YEO XIAO WEI  

[POLICY HOLDER] 

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 
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ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH6897E & SMJ2529Y ALONG/AT PARALLEL PARKING ALONG TRAS STREET  ON 12/07/2020 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please send us photographs of your vehicle (front and back with number plate), accident video and accident scene 
photographs(if any). 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 28 July 2020 10:34 AM 
To: ASKYEO@GMAIL.COM 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH6897E & SMJ2529Y ALONG/AT PARALLEL PARKING ALONG TRAS STREET ON 
12/07/2020 

  

Our Ref: CC4/AIG20007376/Kka3 

  

YEO XIAO WEI  

[POLICY HOLDER] 
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Dear Sir/Madam, 

                                                      

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH6897E & SMJ2529Y ALONG/AT PARALLEL PARKING ALONG TRAS STREET  ON 12/07/2020 

  

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer,  

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 

  

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour. We will 
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 

  

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 
within 10 days from the date of this letter. 

  

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles) 
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed 
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 

  

Please call us if you have further queries. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


