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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Angie Poh Lee Keng <angiepoh@sif.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 16 July 2020 2:58 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Ce: Suzanne Tay Siew Hong; Information Security Officer; Peggy Chan Pek Kay; LKK
Valuation

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR INDICATIVE VALUATION - GBG4081D

Importance: High

Dear Celine,

Refer to your email dated 26 June 2020 and my telephone conversation with you on 15 July 2020 on the subject
matter.

As spoken, you are able to back-date the valuation date to 26 June 2020 as at our request. Please assist to conduct
a formal valuation for the subject vehicle GBG4081D, currently housed at 511 Bukit Batok Street 23 Vicom
Inspection Centre, 2" Level, Singapore 659545 and back-date the valuation report to 26 June 2020.

Please let us have your earliest available date and time for the aforesaid formal valuation so that we can make
arrangement with our agent accordingly.

Please also assist to confirm your valuation cost and when the formal valuation report will be ready.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Angie Poh

Vice President

Credit Collection Department
DID: 6309 7183

Website: www.sif.com.sg
Company Registration No. 196400348D

7/ SING INVESTMENTS
: & FINANCE LIMITED

Inzured up to $75.000 by SDIC wiwwsit-com.sg

This email and any files transmitted with it ("the Email") are confidential and are intended solely for the named addressee. If
you are not the intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute, copy or use the Email for any purpose or disclose the
contents to any person. If you have received the Email in error, please immediately delete it and any record of it from your
system and notify the sender by return email. Thank you.

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) [mailto:celinefong@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 26 June, 2020 1:39 PM
To: Peggy Chan Pek Kay; LKK Valuation



Cc: Suzanne Tay Siew Hong; Angie Poh Lee Keng; Information Security Officer
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR INDICATIVE VALUATION - GBG4081D

Dear Peggy,

The valuation of GBG 4081D is as below:

MV: $42K FS: $35K

As at June 2020

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

Best Regards,
Celine Fong
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Peggy Chan Pek Kay <peggychan@sif.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 26 June 2020 12:02 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; LKK Valuation <valuation@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Suzanne Tay Siew Hong <suzannetay@sif.com.sg>; Angie Poh Lee Keng <angiepoh@sif.com.sg>; Information
Security Officer <secadmin@sif.com.sg>

Subject: REQUEST FOR INDICATIVE VALUATION - GBG4081D

Dear Celine,

Please advise us on the indicative valuation as we have interested buyers asking for quotes on the vehicles.

Best Regards,

Peggy Chan

Assistant Manager

Credit Collection Department
DID: 63097184

Website: www._sif.com.sg
Company Registration No. 196400348D
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Insured up to $75,000 by SDIC

This email and any files transmitted with it ("the Email") are confidential and are intended solely for the named addressee. If you are not the
intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute, copy or use the Email for any purpose or disclose the contents to any person. If you

have received the Email in error, please immediately delete it and any record of it from your system and notify the sender by return email. Thank
you.

From: Peggy Chan Pek Kay
Sent: 25 June 2020 1:45 PM
To: 'Celine Fong (LKKAuto)'; LKK Valuation

Cc: Suzanne Tay Siew Hong; Angie Poh Lee Keng; Information Security Officer
Subject: REQUEST FOR INDICATIVE VALUATION - GBG4081D

Dear Celine,

Please use this attached document. Password remains unchanged.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Peggy Chan

Assistant Manager

Credit Collection Department

DID: 63097184

Website: www.sif.com.sg

Company Registration No. 196400348D
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Insured up to $75,000 by SDIC wiww.sif.comsg

This email and any files transmitted with it ("the Email”) are confidential and are intended salely for the named addressee. If you are not the
intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute, copy or use the Email for any purpose or disclose the contents to any persen. If you

have received the Email in error, please immediately delete it and any record of it from your system and notify the sender by return email. Thank
you.

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) [mailto:celinefong@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: 25 June 2020 1:36 PM

To: Peggy Chan Pek Kay; LKK Valuation

Cc: Suzanne Tay Siew Hong; Angie Poh Lee Keng; Information Security Officer
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR INDICATIVE VALUATION - GBG4081D

Dear Peggy,

Thank you for the email.

Not able to open the folder, it shows Compressed (zipped) Folder Error.



Ve Messign g Lr—n T Vel sw st e maet 13 B2 = =T =N S A=

Y —n . B2 0N Beacs
— L v il rk 5l 1 ~" -
o X L CRIE Bl BEEN ~~ et ver | Sommstrmeim
Opew  Oowd  Bevinesew Lo S A2 Semit Cogry -l
Fros  Afta: Somepes da  daredmemenny A M T Patomertn & Moy SN Ry P
dfiamy et 14 ampmiten PRy T— [ [Rre— el o Sy 2 %0 -
'™ v St - g
REQUEST FOR INDICATIVE VALUATION - GBG4081D tars 2
T 0= gl o bmeel o Mapesst o Wedbes ¢+ DitiCaine » ComtentCumicsd o FTTWINE o QEBGSONTD 00
Pegoy Chan Pek Ky <pegrtren@aul comag . .
oy
e Cutme Fimg LULASE LUK Viuten y - .
buiweny lay Sww bimg Ao Pot Lie b welormmton faruety (M m & Qidraces E-liha Logoma At
£ GRGARTH ay = htmibnd et ===
I Ha T ) -
] ’
Dwar Cotrne = Putwe *
Ploine [ovite Un wih 4 e alive vishuation o e ballowing vabicle - Cobt Bt i ¢ B Congeimed ot e Lo
1
DIAT TOVOTA DYHA 130 381 2902 - GOG4sID o |
LOKIRY DN SEL | 1508 L4768 A Ji, Voo oot compidt hu okaction
[ Sestant -
Fanvo cnd 40 retteve the Siached g e wil b sant in rast sesad t.”'."l | i R dorre ned
Wo will bidorra = ® tha RuThal o haaten oo e doursd & conbirems LESY I
- W S e - - - Sy ise s Z ! [3
lest Hogande W ay
Prgyy Chas B Dyeeta
Axsiveant Marigne ]
Cradit Cobechen Uepenmen B Drarey
Lafy ebo97 184 N Doty
Wonbads LT
Cinmpany Hugniuson fee 1965300 3360 § lerinai c
LT v
AT P R )
Dl o ap —
CEmm e RININENE
— L —
Tl vt dond Wy Bl = Tty b B gt mhbrrren # e Rl T e g el e e e o e N

B - oo I N R e S e e

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

From: Peggy Chan Pek Kay <peggychan@sif.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 25 June 2020 1:07 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@Ikkauto.com>; LKK Valuation <valuation®@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Suzanne Tay Siew Hong <suzannetay@sif.com.sg>; Angie Poh Lee Keng <angiepoh@sif.com.sg>; Information
Security Officer <secadmin@sif.com.sg>

Subject: REQUEST FOR INDICATIVE VALUATION - GBG4081D

Dear Celine,
Please provide us with an indicative valuation on the following vehicle:-

07/17 TOYOTA DYNA 150 5MT 2982 - GBG4081D
LORRY DIESEL L:3500 U:1760

Password to retrieve the attached logcard will be sent in next email.

We will inform you to prepare the formal valuation once we have found a confirmed buyer. Thank you.
4



Best Regards,

Peggy Chan

Assistant Manager

Credit Collection Department
DID: 63097184

Website: www.sif.com.sg
Company Registration No. 196400348D
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Insured up to $75.000 by SDIC viww.sif.com sg

This email and any files transmitted with it ("the Email") are confidential and are intended solely for the named addressee. If you are not the
intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute, copy or use the Email for any purpose or disclose the contents to any person. If you
have received the Email in error, please immediately delete it and any record of it from your system and notify the sender by return email. Thank
you.



Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
*

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 26 June 2020 1:39 PM

To: Peggy Chan Pek Kay; LKK Valuation

Cc: Suzanne Tay Siew Hong; Angie Poh Lee Keng; Information Security Officer
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR INDICATIVE VALUATION - GBG4081D

Dear Peggy,

The valuation of GBG 4081D is as below:

MV: $42K FS: $35K

As at June 2020

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

Best Regards,
Celine Fong
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Peggy Chan Pek Kay <peggychan@sif.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 26 June 2020 12:02 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@Ilkkauto.com>; LKK Valuation <valuation@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Suzanne Tay Siew Hong <suzannetay@sif.com.sg>; Angie Poh Lee Keng <angiepoh@sif.com.sg>; Information
Security Officer <secadmin@sif.com.sg>

Subject: REQUEST FOR INDICATIVE VALUATION - GBG4081D

Dear Celine,

Please advise us on the indicative valuation as we have interested buyers asking for quotes on the vehicles.

Best Regards,

Peggy Chan

Assistant Manager

Credit Collection Department
DID: 63097184



Register New Vehicle (Acknowledgement)
Vehicle Particulars

- Vehide Ma.; GBG4081D R
Vehicle Tyne g:;;gg;p‘o“’ﬁ ‘“;V (Metal Vahicls Schems Normal
Vohide Attactimeanl 1 No Attachment
Vehicle Allachment 2 - Vahicle Aftachment 3¢
Vehicka Make. Tovota  / Vahicle Modal: DYNA 150 SMT
Chassis No.: JTFATISY 70K208237 Enging No . 1KD2712365 ‘
Matar No.: g / Traller Chassss No .
Propeitant: Digsal Passenger Capacity. 2
Engina Capacity; 2882 ¢c Power Rating
Maximum Fower Output -
Unladen Weight: 1720 kg Maximum Laden Weight: 3500 kg
Prinary Colour white LV" Setandsry Colour:
Flis! Reglstration Deta: 31 Jul 2017 J N/ ' Original Registration Date: 31 Jul 2017
Manufatturing Yeas 207 s Open Market Valve: $25436.00
PARF Efigiblity: No Minimum PARF Benefit  $0.00 fA61( bof, )
No. of Transfars: 0 paciconm Regiteaton 5o,
Actus) ARF Paid: $1,322.00 i
Owner Particulars /
Cwner Name: LIBRA ENGINEERING PTE LTD
Owner 1D Type: Company
Owner ID; 2005145010 /

mﬁu’ﬂmﬁd {non-Canda Apt |




>IBack to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years}:
QP Pajd:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 25 Jun 2020

Company
501D

GBG4081D

No

25 Jun 2020
TOYOTA

DYNA 150 5MT
White

2017
1KD2712365
JTFAT35Y70K208237
$26,436.00
31Jul 2017
31Jul 2017

0

$1.322.00

No

$0.00

30 Jul 2027

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$36,879.00
$26,172.00
$26,172.00
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