Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 August 2020 9:03 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: FINALISED SLT3584P

Attachments: 20200803150417812.pdf; 7b90db83-214e-44b8-854a-763ca9d6f1b5.jpg;

5b9be7df-59fb-4a31-b8ec-8a9acd71abal.jpg; ac4ca32f-5f95-407b-bddO-
b63d1f83eadc.jpg; 748366¢1-b37a-4661-83bd-0a79d8141bed. jpg;
50a056ef-1f6b-43a2-bf3d-0529c38822b6.jpg; fe80e79f-718f-459f-
a87a-08017173074f jpg; cdOfd4e2-b5c9-4351-9ac2-127ef25523¢3.jpg;
3799326a-0c84-4256-aeab-42491e507a43.jpg;
f4e9138e-2802-4487-8acb-624f626c5c28.jpg; ed3b15dc-2673-4cd8-
b421-969c906ed22b.jpg

$1247.19 confirmed.

From: Carmen Lim <carmen@esteemperf.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 3 August 2020 2:52 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Shanice Leong <shanice@esteemperf.com.sg>

Subject: FINALISED SLT3584P

Dear Kenneth,
Pls refer to the attached.

Kindly confirm the finalised amount asap.

Thank you

Freundliche GriiBe / Best Regards

Carmen Lim

Accident Claim Executive | Operation
Division

Esteem Performance Pte Ltd

M: 8799 0066
P: 6484 1221
E: carmen@esteemperf.com.sg

5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259
(Head Office)

385 Sin Ming Drive Vicom Inspection
Centre (Showroom)

www.esteemperformance.com

Gor




