9/21/2020 Mail - Asher Sng (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: SCG623E Third Party Claim Against SMR6248P

Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>
Mon 9/21/2020 2:41 PM
To: Yanxin <yanxin@convergence.com.sg>
Cc: weijie <weijie@convergence.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is
clear / under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement
for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation
of repair to your client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the
accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our
surveyor.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Yanxin <yanxin@convergence.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, August 19, 2020 2:18 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>; weijie <weijie@convergence.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SCG623E Third Party Claim Against SMR6248P

Hi Asher,

Are there any further updates as it’s been two weeks from our last email.
Thank you.

Best regards,

Yanxin

Convergence Automotive Pte Ltd
https://outlook.office.com/mail/search/id/AAQKAGVINDIkMTdjLTM3MDgtNDY5ZC 1hZTdkLWQ3ZDMyNTEOMGFhMgAQAF2V1yfRDiVKgPDHANI...  1/4
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13 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 BARTLEY BIZ CENTRE #01-04 SINGAPORE 417807
Office: +65 6976 3531

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: The information contained in this email (including any attachment) is intended only
for the attention of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. Its
unauthorised use, disclosure, storage or copying is not permitted. If you are not the intended recipient, please
permanently delete the original, destroy all copies and inform the sender by return email. Thank you. An e-mail
reply to this address may be subject to interception or monitoring for operational reasons or for lawful business
practices. Convergence Automotive Pte Ltd (Company Reg: 201820703D)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto),

Sent: Thursday, 6 August 2020 4:01 pm

To: Yanxin

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto); weijie

Subject: Re: SCG623E Third Party Claim Against SMR6248P

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS
Hi Sir,
We refer to the email below.

Our insured have yet to report, shall revert to you once we received our insured report.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Yanxin <yanxin@convergence.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, August 3, 2020 4:41 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>; weijie <weijie@convergence.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SCG623E Third Party Claim Against SMR6248P

Hi Asher,

Are there any updates regarding this?

This car has been discharged and we are waiting for the claim reference number so we can send the final billing
to AlG.

Thank you very much!

https://outlook.office.com/mail/search/id/AAQKAGVINDIKMTdjLTM3MDgtNDY5ZC1hZTdkLWQ3ZDMyNTEOMGFhMgAQAF2V1yfRDIVKgPDHANS...  2/4


mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com
mailto:yanxin@convergence.com.sg
mailto:SteveChen@lkkauto.com
mailto:weijie@convergence.com.sg
mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com

9/21/2020 Mail - Asher Sng (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Best regards,
Yanxin
Convergence Automotive Pte Ltd

13 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 BARTLEY BIZ CENTRE #01-04 SINGAPORE 417807
Office: +65 6976 3531

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: The information contained in this email (including any attachment) is intended only
for the attention of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. Its
unauthorised use, disclosure, storage or copying is not permitted. If you are not the intended recipient, please
permanently delete the original, destroy all copies and inform the sender by return email. Thank you. An e-mail
reply to this address may be subject to interception or monitoring for operational reasons or for lawful business
practices. Convergence Automotive Pte Ltd (Company Reg: 201820703D)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto),

Sent: Monday, 27 July 2020 9:25 am

To: Yanxin

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto); weijie

Subject: Re: SCG623E Third Party Claim Against SMR6248P

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir,

We refer to the email below.

Our insured have yet to report, shall revert to you once we received our insured report.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim

related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Yanxin <yanxin@convergence.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, July 25, 2020 10:06 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>; weijie <weijie@convergence.com.sg>
Subject: SCG623E Third Party Claim Against SMR6248P

Hi Asher,

We had filed a third party claim against vehicle SMR6248P however liability isn’t cleared.
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Please follow up and advise us on this.
Thank you very much!

Best regards,
Yanxin
Convergence Automotive Pte Ltd

13 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 BARTLEY BIZ CENTRE #01-04 SINGAPORE 417807
Office: +65 6976 3531

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: The information contained in this email (including any attachment) is intended only
for the attention of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. Its
unauthorised use, disclosure, storage or copying is not permitted. If you are not the intended recipient, please
permanently delete the original, destroy all copies and inform the sender by return email. Thank you. An e-mail
reply to this address may be subject to interception or monitoring for operational reasons or for lawful business
practices. Convergence Automotive Pte Ltd (Company Reg: 201820703D)
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