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RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: Our Ref: D20002687MFSH // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT Accident
involving motor vehicle nos. SJJ6262 A & SHA9526 R ON 06/07/2020

Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Wed 9/30/2020 3:12 PM
To:  Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Dear Asher,
 
You have our mandate to se�le as per follow:
 
COR        : $25,575.57
LOR         : $  2,210.00
To offer  : $27,785.57
 
Thank you.
 
Eric Woo
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Email: EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg
|Company Regn. No. 195000106C | TEL: 6507 3848
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protec�on Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
h�p://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collec�on Statement.
Confiden�ality No�ce: This e-mail is confiden�al. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the
message and all copies from your system and no�fy the sender immediately by return e-mail
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, September 29, 2020 3:52 PM
To: Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: Re: [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: Our Ref: D20002687MFSH // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT Accident involving motor
vehicle nos. SJJ6262 A & SHA9526 R ON 06/07/2020
 
Hi Eric,
 
We refer to the above ma�er.
 
Third party disagreed with our offer and counter proposed 13days  x $170.
 
Please kindly advise on the mandate.
 
Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 

From: Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, September 28, 2020 4:06 PM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
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Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: Our Ref: D20002687MFSH // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT Accident involving motor
vehicle nos. SJJ6262 A & SHA9526 R ON 06/07/2020
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Asher,
 
You have our mandate to se�le as follow:
 
COR: $25,575.57
LOR: $120 - $170 x 10 – 12 days = $1200 - $2040
To offer: $26,775.67 - $27,615.57
 
Please start offering $120.00 / day rental to third-party first.
 
Thank you.
 
Eric Woo
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Email: EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg
|Company Regn. No. 195000106C | TEL: 6507 3848
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protec�on Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
h�p://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collec�on Statement.
Confiden�ality No�ce: This e-mail is confiden�al. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the
message and all copies from your system and no�fy the sender immediately by return e-mail
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Monday, September 14, 2020 3:56 PM
To: Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: Our Ref: D20002687MFSH // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT Accident involving motor vehicle
nos. SJJ6262 A & SHA9526 R ON 06/07/2020
 

Your ref :D20002687MFSH

Our ref : CC4/FCI20007323/R1ea3s2

 

Dear Sirs,

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 9526R (OI) AND SJJ 6262A (TP) ON 06/07/2020

 

We refer to the above matter.

 

The accident occurred when our insured make a right turn at the control junction and hit third party vehicle.

 

Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100%
liability.

 

mailto:EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg
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We seek your approval to offer repairer "CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES (1986) PL "at$ 27,785.57 (all-
in).

 

The summary is as follows: -

 

 Amount Claimed Amount Revised  

1. Cost of Repairs (w/GST) $   32,149.01 $ 25,575.57  

2. Loss of Rental (13days x $170) $     2,210.00 $   2,210.00 (13days x $170)

Total $   36,569.01 $27,785.57  

 

Surveyor recommended 11days for repair.

 

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

 

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.

 
 
Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Sunday, September 6, 2020 2:07 PM
To: Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Our Ref: D20002687MFSH // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SJJ6262 A &
SHA9526 R ON 06/07/2020
 
Hi Eric,
 
We acknowledge your email below.
 
We will generate our report and seek for your approval in due course.
 

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
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Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 
 

From: Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, September 4, 2020 10:41 AM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Our Ref: D20002687MFSH // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SJJ6262 A &
SHA9526 R ON 06/07/2020
 
Without Prejudice

Dear Asher,

A�ached LOD for necessary ac�on.

Please let us have your recommenda�on soonest possible.

Thank you.

Eric Woo
Motor Claim Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Email:
EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group

Personal Data Protec�on Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
h�p://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collec�on Statement.
Confiden�ality No�ce: This e-mail is confiden�al. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom
it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please
delete the message and all copies from your system and no�fy the sender immediately by return e-mail

-----Original Message-----
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 21, 2020 12:10 PM
To: Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
<AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Our Ref: D20002687MFSH // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SJJ6262 A &
SHA9526 R ON 06/07/2020

YOUR REF: D20002687MFSH
LKK REF: CC4/FCI20007323/R1ea3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above ma�er.

We had inspected TP vehicle SJJ 6262A on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for express se�lement.

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
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Enclosed for your perusal is: 
·         TP es�mated cost of repair
·         Preliminary advice

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25
| S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim
related documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed

-----Original Message-----
From: Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 15 July, 2020 5:04 PM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Our Ref: D20002687MFSH // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SJJ 6262 A & SHA
9526 R // Propose for Direct Se�lement

Without Prejudice

Dear Mei Kwan,

A�ached OI SAS as per request.

Thank you.

Eric Woo
Motor Claim Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Email:
EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C A Member of  Insurance Group

Personal Data Protec�on Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
h�p://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collec�on Statement.
Confiden�ality No�ce: This e-mail is confiden�al. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom
it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please
delete the message and all copies from your system and no�fy the sender immediately by return e-mail

-----Original Message-----
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, July 15, 2020 3:50 PM
To: Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Our Ref: D20002687MFSH // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SJJ 6262 A & SHA
9526 R // Propose for Direct Se�lement

YOUR REF: D20002687MFSH
LKK REF: CC4/FCI20007323/ea3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above ma�er.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary ac�on.
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Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher,

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25
| S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim
related documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed

-----Original Message-----
From: Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 15 July, 2020 11:02 AM
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Yik Chan Hoe <chanhoe.yik@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Our Ref: D20002687MFSH Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SJJ 6262 A & SHA 9526 R // Propose for
Direct Se�lement

Without Prejudice

Dear Lkk,

Please note that we are agreeable to Express Se�lement.

Kindly assist to liaise with workshop as per email below on the survey.

Dear Chan Hoe,

Fyi.

Thank you.

Eric Woo
Motor Claim Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Email:
EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C A Member of  Insurance Group

Personal Data Protec�on Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
h�p://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collec�on Statement.
Confiden�ality No�ce: This e-mail is confiden�al. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom
it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please
delete the message and all copies from your system and no�fy the sender immediately by return e-mail

-----Original Message-----
From: Yik Chan Hoe <chanhoe.yik@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, July 15, 2020 8:27 AM
To: Eric Woo <EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Our Ref: D20002687MFSH Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SJJ 6262 A & SHA 9526 R // Propose for
Direct Se�lement

Dear Eric,

Kindly advise whether your insured had reported the accident, if yes, please let us have the liability asap.
16/07/202016/07/2020
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Thanks & Regards,

Yik Chan Hoe
Mercedes-Benz Body Care & Repair Center
Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd
Pandan Loop Service Center
Mobile: 9186 5109 | DID: 6771 4353 | Fax: 6872 1272
Website: www.mercedes-benz.com.sg

-----Original Message-----
From: Yik Chan Hoe
Sent: Monday, 13 July, 2020 7:59 PM
To: Eric Woo
Cc: Serene Ler
Subject: RE: Our Ref: D20002687MFSH Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SJJ 6262 A & SHA 9526 R // Propose for
Direct Se�lement

Dear Eric,

We do not have the footage, our client men�oned in her report that she has a recording but in fact, the SD card dropped
into the centre console of her car as men�oned in the report as well and we are unable to retrieve the SD card.

Thanks & Regards,

Yik Chan Hoe
Mercedes-Benz Body Care & Repair Center
Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd
Pandan Loop Service Center
Mobile: 9186 5109 | DID: 6771 4353 | Fax: 6872 1272
Website: www.mercedes-benz.com.sg

-----Original Message-----
From: Eric Woo [mailto:EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 13 July, 2020 7:13 PM
To: Yik Chan Hoe
Cc: Serene Ler
Subject: RE: Our Ref: D20002687MFSH Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SJJ 6262 A & SHA 9526 R // Propose for
Direct Se�lement

This email was sent from outside of your organisa�on

Without Prejudice

Dear Chan Hoe,

Kindly assist to provide a copy of your client's in car video footage for our reference.

Thank you.

Eric Woo
Motor Claim Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Email:
EricWoo@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C A Member of  Insurance Group
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Personal Data Protec�on Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
h�ps://apc01.safelinks.protec�on.outlook.com/?
url=h�p%3A%2F%2Fwww.msfirstcapital.com.sg%2F&amp;data=01%7C01%7C%7C803a763ea1c84288ae2608d8271da715
%7C8b768fcc12ca4f4c9fde19e8a�863c6%7C0&amp;sdata=jMgD2t7R0a1aocgIWVBfycCZKmX6p0Bfm4Ho4Nw8evs%3D&
amp;reserved=0 for details of PDPA Personal Data Collec�on Statement.
Confiden�ality No�ce: This e-mail is confiden�al. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom
it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please
delete the message and all copies from your system and no�fy the sender immediately by return e-mail

-----Original Message-----
From: Yik Chan Hoe <chanhoe.yik@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 9 July 2020 4:20 pm
To: Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SJJ 6262 A & SHA 9526 R // Propose for Direct Se�lement

To: MS First Capital
A�n: Motor Claims Dept

RE: Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SJJ 6262 A & SHA 9526 R along infront of NUH traffic light junc�on, Accident
date: 06/07/2020

Dear Sir/Mdm,

This email is with regards to the above accident which has been reported by our customer.

We have since been instructed by him/her (motor vehicle number SJJ 6262 A), to submit a claim on his/her behalf as we
are the authorised repair workshop for his/her car.

We note that you are the insurer (3rd party) of the (motor vehicle number SHA 9526 R) involved. As such we are
proposing for a Direct Se�lement with regards to the repair costs and other consequen�al losses.

We appreciate your assistance in this ma�er and look forward to your agreement on this direct se�lement.

I can be reached at chanhoe.yik@cyclecarriage.com.sg

Thanks & Regards,

Yik Chan Hoe
Mercedes-Benz Body Care & Repair Center
Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd
Pandan Loop Service Center
Mobile: 9186 5109 | DID: 6771 4353 | Fax: 6872

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any a�achment to it is confiden�al and intended only for the use of the individual or en�ty
named above and may contain informa�on that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are no�fied that
any dissemina�on, distribu�on or copying of this email or any a�achment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
email in error, please no�fy us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are
those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related
corpora�ons.
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any a�achment to it is confiden�al and intended only for the use of the individual or en�ty
named above and may contain informa�on that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are no�fied that
any dissemina�on, distribu�on or copying of this email or any a�achment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
email in error, please no�fy us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are
those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related
corpora�ons.

16/07/2020
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