Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 24 July 2020 10:55 am

To: City Auto

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SMA 2665J) DOA - 23/04/2020
Attachments: ESTIMATE MARKED.pdf

Dear Vronica,

Confirmed P/P § 3,721.00 @ 3 days of repairs before GST.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: City Auto <cityauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 24 July 2020 9:58 am

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SMA 2665J DOA - 23/04/2020

Dear Shirley,

Thank you for your email.

For labour of spray painting, we would like to request $900.00 due to vehicle is pearl white.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vronica Law



City Auto Pte Ltd

Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate,
#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road,
Singapore 575643

Tel : 6453 1235

Fax : 6453 7944

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 23 July, 2020 6:07 PM

To: 'City Auto'

Cc: SUR

Subject: SMA 2665] DOA - 23/04/2020

Dear Mrs. Quak,

Please confirm P/P $ 3,621.00 @ 3 days of repairs before GST.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.



