
















 

Our Ref:  CC3/QBE20007288/T1es3 

 

 

06 SEPT 2020 

      

RAMU RAVI 

BLK 690 HOUGANG STREET 61 

#02-262 

SINGAPORE 530690 

 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJR 4386Y AND SHB 2343S ON SHB 2343S 

 

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte 

Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto 

Insurance policy taken up with them. 

 

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will 

therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 

 

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and 

settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 

 

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 

30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. 

However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this 

claim and your NCD will be protected.  

 

Please call us if you have further queries. 

 

Yours faithfully, 

 

 

 

Asher 

Case Handler 

DID: 6841 6051 

FAX: 6741 4108 

Email: ashersng@lkkauto.com 

 

c.c. QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd  

             (Motor Claims Dept) 
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[MANDATE REQUEST] Re: VC013792 QBE - SHB2343S AND SJR4386Y ON 09.07.20

Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com>
Fri 9/18/2020 10:05 AM
To:  Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  claims-singapore <claims-singapore@qbe.com>

Dear Asher
 
Please proceed as per advised.
 
regards
 
 

Jenny Toh
Senior Assistant
Claims | Asia
1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 64771225 
Website LinkedIn Twitter

Winner of Insurance Asia Awards 2020 – Digital General Insurance Initiative of the Year, Singapore
Insurance Business Asia List – Top Insurance Workplaces 2020, Asia
 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Thursday, 17 September 2020 9:08 pm
To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com>
Cc: claims-singapore <claims-singapore@qbe.com>
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: VC013792 QBE - SHB2343S AND SJR4386Y ON 09.07.20
 

This email was sent from someone outside of QBE. Be cautious opening links and attachments. Use the
‘Report Phishing’ button if suspicious.

 

Your ref : VC013792
Our ref : CC3/QBE20007288/T1es3q2
 
Dear Sirs,
 

We refer to the above matter.

 

The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle.

 

Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100%
liability.

 

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

 
We seek your approval to offer repairer "COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD" at $1,308.50 (all-in).

https://www.qbe.com/sg
https://www.linkedin.com/company/qbe-asia
https://twitter.com/QBE
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The summary is as follows: -
 
 Amount Claimed Amount Revised  
1. Cost of Repairs (with GST) $   1,694.25 $    950.63  
2. Loss of Rental (2days x $125.19) $      250.38 $    250.38 (2days x $125.19)
3. Loss of Income (2days x $80) $      160.00 $    100.00 (2days x $50)
3. LTA Search Fee $           7.49 $         7.49  

Total  $  2,112.12 $ 1,308.50  
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
 
For your approval please.
 
 
Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 
 

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, July 24, 2020 9:17 AM
To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; claims-singapore <claims-singapore@qbe.com>
Subject: FW: VC013792 QBE - SHB2343S AND SJR4386Y ON 09.07.20
 
Dear Jenny,
 
Thank you for your email.
 
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
 
Hi Asher,
 
FYNA, our ref CC3/QBE20007288/T1es3
 
 
* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
                                                              
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li | Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6261 5037 Email: SuLi@lkkauto.com| Fax : 6271 8802

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Branch : Blk 1007, Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-11 | S(159721)

 

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
mailto:suli@lkkauto.com
mailto:jenny.toh@qbe.com
mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:claims-singapore@qbe.com
mailto:SuLi@lkkauto.com%7C
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From: Jenny Toh [mailto:jenny.toh@qbe.com] 
Sent: Thursday, 23 July 2020 5:26 PM
To: Su Li (LKK Auto)
Cc: claims-singapore
Subject: VC013792 QBE - SHB2343S AND SJR4386Y ON 09.07.20
 
Your ref: LKK REF - CC3/QBE20007288/T1es3
 
Dear Su Li
 
Attached the third party for your necessary action.
 
 

Jenny Toh
Senior Assistant
Claims  / Asia
1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6224 6633 | +65 6477 1225
Website LinkedIn Twitter  

 
 
From: Sabrina Tan Quee Ping <SabrinaTan@cdge.com.sg> 
Sent: Wednesday, 22 July 2020 10:34 am
To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com>; Andrew Lim <andrew.lim@qbe.com>
Cc: Catherine Koh Mui Gek <catherinekoh@cdge.com.sg>
Subject: QBE - SHB2343S AND SJR4386Y ON 09.07.20
 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

 

Dear Sirs

M/s QBE Insurance (Int'l) Ltd

 

Attached are our LOD documents for the above subject matter.

 

Kindly review and settle our claims amicably with our Ms Catherine Koh who is copied herein.

Tel: 6214 8733     Fax: 62141843     Email: catherinekoh@cdge.com.sg

 

Thank you

 

Best Regards

Sabrina Tan

Claims Department / ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd 
Tel : 6214 8732 /  Fax : 6214 1843
Please consider the environment before printing this email.  * _ *

mailto:jenny.toh@qbe.com
https://www.qbe.com/sg
https://www.linkedin.com/company/qbe/
https://twitter.com/QBE
mailto:SabrinaTan@cdge.com.sg
mailto:jenny.toh@qbe.com
mailto:andrew.lim@qbe.com
mailto:catherinekoh@cdge.com.sg
mailto:catherinekoh@cdge.com.sg


9/18/2020 Mail - Asher Sng (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/search/id/AAQkAGVlNDlkMTdjLTM3MDgtNDY5ZC1hZTdkLWQ3ZDMyNTE0MGFhMgAQAHUClENHP0Ifk0%2BU7… 4/4

 

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us
and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not
allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its related
companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding
agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the
duly authorised representatives of both parties. 

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you to print
this only if necessary. 

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]

 

------------------ IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be
privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure
or copying of this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please
promptly inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
produced.
------------------ IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be
privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any
disclosure or copying of this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in
error, please promptly inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy
any hard copies produced.


