Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 July, 2020 2:11 PM

To: Peter Lim; 'assignments@Ilkkauto.com’; Nivitha (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR INSPECTION - SLW2714Y (LIM MOTOR PTE LTD) Our Ref:

20/20/20/VC05/023458 [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Without Prejudice

Dear Samantha

Thank you for confirming the appointment of a Single Joint Expert.
Dear Nivitha (LKK)

Please arrange Xing Guo Qiang to conduct TP survey.

Thanks,

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

lonpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Peter Lim [mailto:admin@I|scauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 14 July 2020 2:08 PM

To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Cc: Customer SG <customer_sg@lonpac.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: Re: REQUEST FOR INSPECTION - SLW2714Y (LIM MOTOR PTE LTD) Our Ref: 20/20/20/VC05/023458
[External General]

Hi Li Li

We would like to select Mr. Xing Guo Qiang from your list. Klndly let us know
the date/time of the survey.

Thanks



Samantha

On Tue, Jul 14, 2020 at 12:28 PM ONG LI LI <llong @lonpac.com> wrote:

Lonpac External - General

Without Prejudice

Dear Samantha

They are from Quantum Risk, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd and Appraisal Associates.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all TN |[onpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Peter Lim [mailto:admin@I|scauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 14 July 2020 12:24 PM

To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Cc: Customer SG <customer_sg@lonpac.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: Re: REQUEST FOR INSPECTION - SLW2714Y (LIM MOTOR PTE LTD) Our Ref: 20/20/20/VC05/023458
[External General]




Hi Li Li

We spoke and thanks for the call.

Kindly let us have the company names which they represent.

Thanks

Samantha

On Tue, Jul 14, 2020 at 12:21 PM ONG LI LI <llong @lonpac.com> wrote:

Lonpac External - General

Without Prejudice

Save as to Costs

Dear Sir/Mdm

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s
vehicle jointly with your client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor
surveyors named in the following list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint
expert.

Paul Thanapal
Xing Guo Qiang
Mohamad Taufikh
Lim Teow Guan
Adrian Ling
Marcus Chua
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Kenneth Kong
Bryan Ang
Nicholas Tey
Jackson Quek

(@R I\o} (oo} RN

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of
any of these motor surveyors as a single joint expert.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse

Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Peter Lim [mailto:admin@I|scauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 14 July 2020 11:58 AM

To: Customer SG <customer_sg@Ilonpac.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@I|onpac.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN
<geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Subject: REQUEST FOR INSPECTION - SLW2714Y (LIM MOTOR PTE LTD)

Dear Sir/Madam



We would like to submit a claim against vehicle number YN7812H (Insured under
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD). Kindly arrange for pre-inspection.

Enclosed reports for your easy reference.

Peter/Samantha

Thank You & Best Regards

Lim Motor Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive
Sin Ming AutoCity
#05-20

Singapore 575722
65527761 (0)

69092494 (F)

Thank You & Best Regards

Lim Motor Pte Ltd
Lim Siang Chow Auto Service
160 Sin Ming Drive
Sin Ming AutoCity

#05-20



Singapore 575722
65527761 (0)

69092494 (F)

Thank You & Best Regards

Lim Motor Pte Ltd

Lim Siang Chow Auto Service
160 Sin Ming Drive

Sin Ming AutoCity

#05-20

Singapore 575722

65527761 (O)

69092494 (F)



