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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Motor Claims, Otto Car <melvin.ottocar@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 July 2020 3:02 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SMJ 3339Y - Finalize

=== WITHOUT PREJUDICE === 
 
Dear Guo Qiang, 
 
Confirmed $1750 and 2 working days. 
 
 
Regards, 
Melvin 
Mobile: 9369 5044 
 

Otto Car Pte Ltd 
176 Sin Ming Drive, #02-16 Sin Ming Autocare, Singapore 575721. 
 
 
On Tue, 28 Jul 2020 at 11:16, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Melvin, 
  
Attached my adjusted marking. 
 

Regards, 
Guo Qiang 

 

 

发件人: Motor Claims, Otto Car <melvin.ottocar@gmail.com> 

发送时间: 2020年7月27日 21:42 

收件人

收件人收件人

收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 

主

主主

主题: Re: SMJ 3339Y - Finalize  

  
=== WITHOUT PREJUDICE === 
 
Dear Guo Qiang, 
 
The amount seems to be wrong. 
 
We attach your marked estimate. 
The amount should be $2,400. 
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Please confirm. 
 
 
Regards, 
Melvin 
Mobile: 9369 5044 
 

Otto Car Pte Ltd 
176 Sin Ming Drive, #02-16 Sin Ming Autocare, Singapore 575721. 
 
 
On Mon, 27 Jul 2020 at 19:15, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Melvin, 
  
Finalize COR $1750 before GST @ 2 working days. 
 

Regards, 
Guo Qiang 

 


