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21-JUL-2020

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
36 ROBINSON ROAD, CITY HOUSE #16-01
SINGAPORE 068877

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT ON 09-Jul-2020 INVOLVING SJR3536M & SH7618E AT YISHUN AVENUE 8

We are authorised repair workshop for the owner of vehicle, SJIR3536M, which was involved in the captioned accident with your
insured's vehicle. The vehicle owner has requested and authorised us to assist him/her in presenting his claim against the party
responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured, SH7618E, we are submitting these claims for your consideration on
behalf of the owner/driver/claimant.

. Cost of Repair $4,708.00
. Car Rental -
. Loss of Use (5 x $120.00) $600.00
. Survey Fees =
. LTA Fees $7.45
. TP/GIA Fees -
. Medical Fees -
. Others -

(E&OE) $5,315.45
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We enclosed the following documents to support the claims:-

Repair/Excess Bill GIA/Police Report(s) I:] Power of Attorney l:' Medical Bill
I:' Surveyor Report GIA/TP Search I:I Car Rental Bill D Witness Statement

D Coloured Photographs D Insurance Certificate Others : S\LNED  LOA

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our client's claim as soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of
the owner/driver/claimant.

Yours faithfully,
ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD
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SHARIFAH

Claim Department
Email : SWapleftH @.Mzmmw\.com
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Date : 10-Jul-2020
From : GOH SIEW CHUANG (Name of Policyholder)

My Vehicle No. : SJR3536M Other Vehicles : SH7618E
Accident Date : 09-Jul-2020 Location : YISHUN AVENUE 8
LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

To : MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED (Third Party and/or Third Party Insurer)

I have authorised ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD to proceed with the repairs to my accident damaged vehicle and to proceed
with 3rd Party Insurance Claims against Third Party and / or its Insurer on my behalf for property damages, costs, and
expenses, including loss of use, loss of rental, medical fees and legal costs.

To have absolete discretion to agree to any settlement of compensation amount in respect of my/our claim against third
party (except personal injuries and medical claims).

As ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD will be handling the entire 3rd Party Claims, which includes signing / submission of all
relevant documents and negotiation of my claims on my behalf, kindly forward and make payable all proceeds to my
claims to ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD.

I confirm that the payment of any negotiated settlement with and accepted by ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD will serve as
an effectual discharge of my claims against the Third Party and / or its Insurer for the damage caused.
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Policyholder's Signature / Company's Stamp (if applicable) Withness's Signature
Name : GOH SIEW CHUANG Name : SHARIFAH
NRICNo. /ROC No.7» SlE 3. 22 L b NRIC No. :

Designation :
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PROFORMA INVOICE: HQPI00119

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
36 ROBINSON ROAD, CITY HOUSE #16-01 068877
CONTACT : 65073848

VEHICLE NO : SJIR3536M

MAKE : TOYOTA

MODEL : HARRIER 2.0 PREMIUM AT AIRBAG 2WD
5DR

MILEAGE : OKM

DATE : 21-JUL-2020
JOB SHEET NO : HQJIS04360
SERVICE ADVISOR : SHARIFAH
JOB START : 2020-07-14 10:27:00
JOB COMPLETED : 2020-07-16 11:00:08
PAGE : 10F1

NO STOCK CODE DESCRIPTION

QTY UNITPRICE SUM (SGD)

1 CLAIM COST OF REPAIR FOR VEHICLE SJR3536M (THIRD 1 4,400.00 4,400.00
PARTY CLAIM) DOA: 09/07/2020 CLAIM AGAINST
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED /
SH7618E
SGD : FOUR THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED AND EIGHT ONLY SUB-TOTAL : 4,400.00
GST-7 % : 308.00
TOTAL : 4,708.00

ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD

PREPARED BY



AbwinM?9 - Sharifah

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

LTA <LTA-VTL@lta.gov.sg>

Friday, 10 July, 2020 3:06 PM

sharifah@abwinm9.com

Notification of Successful Vehicle Insurance Search for Receipt No.:
ITNET-00000-200710-000955

Land Tra Iispor&Authority

Dear Sir/Madam

We wish to inform you that your transaction on "Enquire Vehicle Insurance Particulars"
performed on 10 Jul 2020 was successful and the Receipt No. is ITNET-00000-200710-
000955.

2. The details of the search results are as follow:
Vehicle No. Search Date = Search Time Search Result

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE
LIMITED

3. Please contact our customer service officers at tel : 1800-CALL LTA (1800-2255 582)
should you require further assistance.

SH7618E 09 Jul 2020 17:20:00

4. Visit www.onemotoring.com.sg for more information, or go to www.lta.gov.sg/feedback if
you have any feedback. This email is auto-generated, please do not reply to this email.

5. Thank you.

If you are not the intended recipient of this communication, please delete it.

As it may contain confidential or official information, do not retain it or disclose the contents to any person as it
may be an offence under the Official Secrets Act.



