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Yr ref tO2&2727MFSH
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29th August 2020

Dear Sir/Mdm,

MS FIRST CAP]TAL INSURANCE LTD

NO.36

ROBllr|SON RDS1E01

ctw HousE

SINGAPORE O6i877

2l Repair tax invoice
3) Letter of authorization

-
As instructed, we are claiming the following as stated below:-

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Accidcnt inyolvinq SHA3260X and SGUI689Y on 0710712020

We refer to the above said accident.

- We enclosed herewith relevant documents as statd belowi

- 1) Accident report of SGU}589Y

, 1) Cost of repair
2) Loss of Rental (SDays x S 120.00)

' S 2,sL4.5o
s 600.00

Total $ 3,11/L50

We do not have the survey report and photographs as our client's motor vehicle was
surveyed by your appointed surveyor.

Please kindly let us know whether you are prepared to settle our client's claim & we
look forward to hear kom you soonest.

Thanks & regards CITYAUTO PTE LTD
Blk 8 Sin Ming Road

#01-58/60/62 Sin Ming lnd Esr
Singapore 575643

Tel:6453 1235 Fax: 64537944

Vronica Law (Claim dept.)
Tel:6453 1235

Fax:64537944
Email : cityauto@sinenet.com.se

(Claims Section)





n*Slf irstCaBitat

CTAIM REFERENCE

ACCffiilTDATE

a

HS Fir!;tcapiAn Insrranc€ Llrnit€d co,rpg, r{o. 19soo01r6c csT.Req. f,!o_ !42-ouol6rs-9

6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore O48g8O

Teli (6s) 5222 2311 Fax: (65) 6azA 3s47

dh.. H.b. h.,ffiidrrD.* 36 Robinson Roed #16-0lcity t{ous€ Singapore

rxscHAReE ffiqEtPT

D2$O272ruFSH

47fr1t':tg2o

COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD

ONG WEE TIONG (WAi,lG VT/EIZHOI.IG)

$lA32qX

sGL3689Y

$3,0til.gl

ACffDEhlr,Lip6Alroilr ; E IP: ffiAtr FReiI $,Q9OLAHE A\1E 1? ro lrl@D{.&*DE *!rE 1

INSURED

INSURED DRTVER

IITSI.REO VEHICLE

I'{\/OL\I|EO PARTY

SETTLEI'ENT St.h,l

lrfi6' tt€ uilrotnebd Cf,{mirf b.*tglha personfunti$ anti0edto pceisettrconrpeosdlm h re&ilion tolfie aeciie$(
heteby agee b acces the SETTLEIT'ENT suu 6 if ard fiml seiltsment ot a[ dairns for darnages, costs t
tlisborseme*s arisiag out d lhe ACCEENT. ard ulllE abo agree *tat 0re sait s€ffiemeot arm:
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in any elaims or actions which may be made against them 6r afly of them.
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Y 24hrsTowingServices T*9A2B9S9S
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iis FIRSTCAPITAL INSURAI{CE LTD
NO.38
ROBINSON RD #lEOl
CITY HOUSE
SINGAPORE 068877

Attention: MOTOR CIAIM DEPARTMENT

Tax lnvoice : 1202008-000886

Dale:29|ABDO20
Vehbb No.: SGL3689Y

Make / Model : HONDAJMZ 1.5LAf,ABS tyAB
HID2TM)sDR

Mileage (lrn) : 135044
Chassis No" : JHMGE88509S201 711

Accijent Oale : O7 lO7 12O20

Claim No. : D20,O2727MFSH

Reference : JO202@74309

Policy No- : GA531087/1

2,3s0.00

I
I

Contact : 65073848

t Lunpsum repair

Fax No. :65073849

.t

Total S$:

GST @ 7% S$:

Grand Total S$: 2,514.50

ClTy AUTO PTE LTD cAsH / NErs / cREDrr CARD pAyMENroNLy

2,350.00

164.50

Blk 6 Sin Ming Road
#01-58/60/62 Sin Ming lnd Est

SingaPore 575643
Tel:6453 i2g5 Fax 6453 7944

(Chims Section)

Custo*er's Signature/Co. Stanp for CITYAUTO FTE LTD

Please note allnorks performed by City Auto Pte Ltd as performed in this invoice is subjqcted tc the following hArrang
conditions:
1) Any replaoement of electrbal cornponents will carry 1 nnnth wananty period from date of this invoice.
2) Any replacernent of nrechanical ecnponents will carry 3 months rivananty period
Please note that all wananty does not cover wear and tear conditions regardless of any conponents.
City Auto Pte Ltd reseryes the right to detern*ne any wananty conditions

Thank You For Your Business !



A



A Jude
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 2 February 2021 4:21 PM
To: 'Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan'
Cc: Jason Tea; Admin A
Subject: RE: [MANDATE GIVEN - EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - 

D20002727MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

Dear Vic, 
 
Content noted with thanks  
 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email:  CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan [mailto:VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, 2 February 2021 2:58 PM 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [MANDATE GIVEN - EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20002727MFSH/1 // 
EXPRESS SETTLEMENT 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
We refer to your below email. 
 
We agree to your recommendation to settle the matter @ $3,014.50 (all in). 
 
Thank you. 
 
Kind Regards, 
 
Vic Sanghilan 
Motor Claim Department 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  
| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3846 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. 
No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
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Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 19 January 2021 3:19 pm 
To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20002727MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT 
 

Your ref : D20002727MFSH 

Our ref : CC4/FCI20007222/Kgs3q2            

            Dear Sirs/Madam, 

            ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 3260X & SGL 3689Y ON 07/07/2020 

            We refer to the above matter. 

            It is a head-to-rear collision. Liability is not in our driver’s favour.  

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "CITY AUTO PTE LTD" at $3,014.50. 

 The summary is as follows: - 

  

 Amount Claimed Amount Revised 
Cost of Repair (w/GST) $  6,721.70 $   2,514.50 
Loss of Rental (5days x 
$120.00) 

$     600.00 $      500.00 (5days x 
$100.00) 

Loss of Income  $     - $     - 
LTA/GIA Search Fee $     - $     - 
Total $  7,321.70 $   3,014.50 

**04 days recommendation for repair + 1PRS = 05 days 

            Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 

            For your approval/instruction please. 

 

Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email:  CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


