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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Autosoon Soon <autosoon1@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 30 November 2020 12:23 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Autosoon soon; Kurup & Boo Advocate & Solicitors

Subject: Re: SMT 3016B - Finalize

Hello Guo Chiang, 

 

Thanks and the amended estimate price list  is well received. 

 

We hereby confirmed the amount at $9201.69 before GST  
@ 5 working days. 
 

Regards, 
Soon 

 

On Mon, 30 Nov 2020 at 11:13, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Soon, 
  
Finalize COR $9201.69 before GST @ 5 working days. 
  
Regards, 
Guo Qiang 

 

 

发件人: Autosoon Soon <autosoon1@gmail.com> 

发送时间: 2020年 11月 30日 10:13 

收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>; Autosoon soon <autosoon1@gmail.com> 

抄送: Kurup & Boo Advocate & Solicitors <boo@kurupnboo.com.sg> 

主题: Re: SMT 3016B - Finalize  

  

Hi Guo Chiang,  

 

Your ref: SMT3016B 

 

Attached the Toyota agent list price for your kind attention 

 

Our estimated parts price, there is a variation on prices 

from the agent as follows: 

 

Kindly amend your final wrong amount accordingly. 

 

Thanks and regards, 

Soon  

cc: BMC.3517.20wh 

 

 

On Mon, 30 Nov 2020 at 09:32, Autosoon Soon <autosoon1@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hello Guo Chiang,  
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Thanks and noted your delayed finalisation matter, kindly 

be informed the alloy rim amount is below our costs for the  

replacement. 

 

We will submit the alloy wheel invoice for your kind attention 

asap, waiting for our supplier to revert to us on the invoices 

kindly hold your hands in this matter.  

 

Thanks and regards, 

Soon 

  

 

On Sat, 28 Nov 2020 at 16:03, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Soon, 
  
Finalize COR $7647.89 before GST @ 5 working days. 
  
Regards, 
Guo Qiang 

 


