Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: fast werkz <fastwerkzgarage@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 July, 2020 4:03 PM

To: Motor Claims; Summer Lee (LKK Auto); assignments@Ilkkauto.com;
sur@lkkauto.com

Cc: Ngian, Kelvyna

Subject: RE: Our Ref:CLMOMVC000003853, DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SKP4818S AND
YP1635G

Hi Shery,

As mentioned, my workshop address follows —

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #02-13 Premier @ Kaki Bukit (Gate 1) Singapore 415875
Thank you

Regards

Derek Oh
82900041
Fast Werkz Garage Pte Ltd

Sent from Mail for Windows 10

From: Motor Claims
Sent: Wednesday, 8 July 2020 3:51 pm
To: fast werkz; Summer Lee (LKK Auto); assignments@lkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com

Cc: Ngian, Kelvyna
Subject: RE: Our Ref:CLMOMVC000003853, DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SKP4818S AND YP1635G

Without Prejudice

Dear Derek,

Noted on your email, we will conduct PRI on a without prejudice basis.

Aside to LKK,
Please accept assignment for TP survey.

Thank you.

For all first claim notifications on Property & Casualty Claims (excluding Motor claims), please email to
GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com

For motor claims enquiries, please email to motorclaims@sg.gaig.com

For all first claim notifications on Marine Claims, please email to marineclaims@sg.gaig.com
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Regards
Shery Wong, Executive, Claims | P. +65 68046077 | F. +65 62353354 | shery.wong@sg.gaig.com
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For more information on our financial ratings, visit GAIG.com/FinancialStrength.

ANCE

Pony

A+ (Superior)
Affirmed September 11, 2019

Thank you for your trust in us. We're proud to continue to serve you during this unprecedented
time. As COVID-19 continues to affect us all, we assure you that we remain committed to providing
the high level of service you deserve. Read more.

From: fast werkz <fastwerkzgarage@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 8, 2020 3:47 PM

To: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: Ngian, Kelvyna <kelvyna.ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] RE: Our Ref:CLMOMVC000003853, DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SKP4818S AND YP1635G

Hi Shery,

Thanks for your email, kindly arrange LKK Auto Consultants for the survey.
Regards

Derek Oh

82900041
Fast Werkz Garage Pte Ltd

Sent from Mail for Windows 10

From: Motor Claims
Sent: Wednesday, 8 July 2020 2:53 pm
To: fast werkz

Cc: Ngian, Kelvyna
Subject: Our Ref:CLMOMVC000003853, DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SKP4818S AND YP1635G

Without Prejudice

GAIG Ref: CLMOMVC000003853

Dear Sirs,

We append the following list of our panel surveyors:-



1.  AJAX Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd

2. A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte. Ltd.
3. Priority Services

4, RT Appraisal Pte Ltd

5.  LKK Auto Consultants

Kindly let us know which SJE is selected for the survey to be carried out.

For all first claim notifications on Property & Casualty Claims (excluding Motor claims), please email to
GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com

For motor claims enquiries, please email to motorclaims@sg.gaig.com

For all first claim notifications on Marine Claims, please email to marineclaims@sg.gaig.com

Regards
Shery Wong, Executive, Claims | P. +65 68046077 | F. +65 62353354 | shery.wong@sg.gaig.com
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For more information on our financial ratings, visit GAIG.com/FinancialStrength.

Thank you for your trust in us. We're proud to continue to serve you during this unprecedented
time. As COVID-19 continues to affect us all, we assure you that we remain committed to providing
the high level of service you deserve. Read more.

From: fast werkz <fastwerkzgarage@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 8, 2020 2:45 PM

To: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR SKP4818S AND YP1635G

Hi Shery,

As spoken over the phone earlier, possible to arrange survey today for the above Direct Settlement Case.
Thank you very much.

Regards

Derek Oh
82900041



Fast Werkz Garage Pte Ltd

Sent from Mail for Windows 10

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.



