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[MANDATE GIVEN] Re: ES LKK - SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D20002640MFSH ; YOUR
REF: GBF5003D

Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Thu 9/17/2020 1:43 PM
To:  Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Dear Asher,
 
We refer to your below email.
 
Please offer to se�le the ma�er from $2,019.45 - $2,079.45. Start offer LOU @ $100/day.
 
Thank you.
 
Kind Regards,
 
Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877
| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3846 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No.
195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protec�on Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
h�p://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collec�on Statement.
 
Confiden�ality No�ce: This e-mail is confiden�al. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the
message and all copies from your system and no�fy the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Monday, 14 September 2020 4:58 pm
To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: ES LKK - SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D20002640MFSH ; YOUR REF: GBF5003D
 
Your ref :D20002640MFSH
Our ref : CC4/FCI20007116/R1es3q2
 
Dear Sirs,
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 6229B (OI) AND GBF 5003D (TP) ON 01/07/2020
 
We refer to the above ma�er.
 
The accident occurred when our insured make a le� turn into the main road hi�hird party vehicle.
 
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to se�le third-party claim at 100% liability.
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer "VENDA ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE  LTD "at$ 2,079.45 (all-in).
 ,
The summary is as follows: -
 

 Amount Claimed Amount Revised  
1. Cost of Repairs (w/GST) $   2,522.62 $ 1,712.00  
2. Loss of Use (4days x $120) $      480.00 $    360.00 (3days x $120)
3. LTA Search Fee $           7.45 $        7.45

mailto:vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg/
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Total $    3,010.07 $ 2.079.45  
 
Surveyor recommended 3days for repair.
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruc�on.
 
 
Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 
 

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 16, 2020 10:41 AM
To: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Venda Claims Dept <claims@vendaengrg.com.sg>
Subject: FW: ES LKK - SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D20002640MFSH ; YOUR REF: GBF5003D
 

Dear Sir / Madam,

 

Thank you for your email.

 

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

 

Hi Asher

 

FYNA, our ref CC4/FCI20007116/R1es3

 

 

* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

                                                              

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li | Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
mailto:suli@lkkauto.com
mailto:JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg
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Phone: 6261 5037 Email: SuLi@lkkauto.com| Fax : 6271 8802

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Branch : Blk 1007, Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-11 | S(159721)

 

From: Jason Tea [mailto:JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg] 
Sent: Thursday, 16 July 2020 10:18 AM
To: Venda Claims Dept
Cc: Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Subject: ES LKK - SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D20002640MFSH ; YOUR REF: GBF5003D

 

Dear Venda,

 

We can agree to an express settlement.

 

Case will be handled by LKK on our behalf.

 

Dear LKK,

 

Liability clear, please put up mandate for settlement.

 

 

Regards

Jason Tea

Motor Claims

 

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA

Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward,

disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by

return e-mail.

 

With effect from 15 January 2018, we will be known as MS First Capital Insurance Limited. Our new website will be
www.msfirstcapital.com.sg.

 

As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are on Work From Home
arrangement.

 

mailto:SuLi@lkkauto.com%7C
mailto:JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg/
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However, our office is open and we are actively working to support our clients and partners. We have access to e-mails and will work to
respond in a timely manner.

 

We appreciate your understanding on this matter.

 

Our Motor Claim email address is:

motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg

 

Thank you and have a nice day.

 

From: Venda Claims Dept <claims@vendaengrg.com.sg> 
Sent: Thursday, 16 July 2020 9:50 am
To: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: ES LKK - SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D20002640MFSH ; YOUR REF: GBF5003D

 

Hi Jason Tea,

 

We did not have any video footage.

Thank you.

 

Pei Jin

Venda Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

No 8 Tuas Avenue 18

Singapore 638892

(Level 3_Office)

(Level 5_Workshop)

Tel : 8126 8587

 

On Thu, Jul 16, 2020 at 9:39 AM Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Venda,

 

Before we reply on liability. Please advise us whether your client’s vehicle got any video footage.

 

Regards

Jason Tea

Motor Claims

mailto:motor_claims@first-insurance.com.sg
mailto:claims@vendaengrg.com.sg
mailto:JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com
mailto:JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg
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Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of

PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy,

forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender

immediately by return e-mail.

 

With effect from 15 January 2018, we will be known as MS First Capital Insurance Limited. Our new website will be
www.msfirstcapital.com.sg.

 

As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are on Work From Home
arrangement.

 

However, our office is open and we are actively working to support our clients and partners. We have access to e-mails and will
work to respond in a timely manner.

 

We appreciate your understanding on this matter.

 

Our Motor Claim email address is:

motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg

 

Thank you and have a nice day.

 

From: Venda Claims Dept <claims@vendaengrg.com.sg> 
Sent: Thursday, 16 July 2020 9:16 am
To: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: Re: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D20002640MFSH ; YOUR REF: GBF5003D

 

Hi Jason Tea,

 

Attached LOC document and ATA for your attention please.

Kindly assist to revert us with the liability issue/offer if direct settlement is in order.    

 

Pei Jin

Venda Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

No 8 Tuas Avenue 18

Singapore 638892

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg/
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg/
mailto:motor_claims@first-insurance.com.sg
mailto:claims@vendaengrg.com.sg
mailto:JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg
mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
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(Level 3_Office)

(Level 5_Workshop)

Tel : 8126 8587

 

On Wed, Jul 8, 2020 at 2:44 PM Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir,

 

I am the officer in charge for this matter.

 

As there is no estimate submitted, we can only agree to a direct settlement subject to damage consistency
and number of repair days as recommended by our surveyor

 

Please submit estimate to us and LKK so that we can see whether we can direct settle this case.

 

Thanks

 

 

Regards

Jason Tea

Motor Claims

 

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of

PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy,

forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender

immediately by return e-mail.

 

With effect from 15 January 2018, we will be known as MS First Capital Insurance Limited. Our new website will be
www.msfirstcapital.com.sg.

 

As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are on Work From Home
arrangement.

 

However, our office is open and we are actively working to support our clients and partners. We have access to e-mails and will
work to respond in a timely manner.

 

We appreciate your understanding on this matter.

mailto:JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg/
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg/
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Our Motor Claim email address is:

motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg

 

Thank you and have a nice day.

 

From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Sent: Wednesday, 8 July 2020 2:41 pm
To: CLAIMS@VENDAENGRG.COM.SG
Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Jason Tea
<JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D20002640MFSH ; YOUR REF: GBF5003D

 

Dear Sir/Madam

PRI Request For GBF5003D Accident Involving SH6229B On 01-07-2020 AT 10:40:00HRS. 

Please find below details for your reference

Claim number : D20002640MFSH
Insured vehicle number : SH6229B
Accident date : 01-07-2020
Third-party vehicle number : GBF5003D
Assignment type : DIRECT SETTLEMENT
Surveyor : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Officer-in-Charge : JASON TEA CHEE KIAT

 
PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

Regards,
Admin Team
Claim Workflow System
Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848
Fax : 6507 3849
 

mailto:motor_claims@first-insurance.com.sg
mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
mailto:CLAIMS@VENDAENGRG.COM.SG
mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
mailto:JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg

