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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 5 November 2020 2:33 PM
To: Foo Chit Yan (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA)
Cc: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses); Admin A
Subject: RE: OUR REF: BUS/01/16/7025; YOUR REF: CC3/CTI17004323/K1DBV3Q2-1; 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB279Z & GQ9234K ON 20.01.16 ALONG WOODLANDS 
REGIONAL INTERCHANGE

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GQ 9234K & SMB 279Z ON 20/01/2016 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please be informed that our principal have repudiated the claim due to our insured breach of policy terms 
and conditions. 
 
As such, you may forward the claim to our insured directly. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Foo Chit Yan (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA) [mailto:FooChitYan@smrt.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, 3 November 2020 12:14 PM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Subject: OUR REF: BUS/01/16/7025; YOUR REF: CC3/CTI17004323/K1DBV3Q2-1; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB279Z & 
GQ9234K ON 20.01.16 ALONG WOODLANDS REGIONAL INTERCHANGE 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Jia Le, 
 
We refer to the above matter 
 
We claim on behalf of SMRT Buses Ltd, owner of the vehicle registration number SMB279Z. Your client's negligent 
driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses:  
 
Cost of repair: $1,550.00 
Loss of Use: $700.00 ($350.00 x 2 days) 
LTA Search fee: $5.00 
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Total: $2,105.00 
 
Kindly let us have your offer 
 
We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email. Payment by 
cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT Buses Ltd. 
 
Kind Regards, 
 
Jimmy Foo 
Claims and Insurance Agency 
Direct line +65 6556 3521| ChitYan@smrt.com.sg 
6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62 
Singapore 569140 

 
 


