Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Chris Bulaclac <chris.bulaclac@ccfulco.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 27 July 2020 5:35 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto); Mars Ler; Renemer Bagang

Subject: FW: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D20002644MFSH ; YOUR REF: SLQ4759L
FINALIZATION

Attachments: SLQ4759L FIN.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Khanchna,
Please assist to finalize.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Christopher L. Bulaclac

Assistant Manager- Customer Service
H/P 96552177 D/D 65949160

email : chris.bulaclac@ccfulco.com.sg

Cycle & Carriage Fulco Motor Dealer Pte Ltd
330 UBI Road 3 Singapore 408650

Tel : 67461000 Fax : 64875857

From: Mars Ler

Sent: Saturday, 18 July 2020 09:44

To: 'adrianling@Ilkkauto.com' <adrianling@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Chris Bulaclac <chris.bulaclac@ccfulco.com.sg>; Renemer Bagang <renemer.bagang@ccfulco.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D20002644MFSH ; YOUR REF: SLQ4759L FINALIZATION
Dear Adrian,

Good morning, as per attach for your reference, please help to finalize . (5 working days)

In view of the current COVID-19 situation , please bear with us should there be some service delay during this period .
Thank you,

Best regards

Mars Ler

Senior Advisor - Motor Claims
Cycle & Carriage Fulco Motor Dealer Pte Ltd



330 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408650
D/D 65949163 H/P 91792566

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 3 July 2020 1:47 PM

To: Mars Ler

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; RACHELWU@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D20002644MFSH ; YOUR REF: SLQ4759L

Dear Sir/Madam

PRI Request For SLQ4759L Accident Involving SHD3008T On 02-07-2020 AT 07:15:00HRS.
Please find below details for your reference

e Claim number : D20002644MFSH

e Insured vehicle number : SHD3008T

e Accident date : 02-07-2020

¢ Third-party vehicle number : SLQ4759L

e Assignment type : DIRECT SETTLEMENT

e Surveyor : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
o Officer-in-Charge : RACHELWU LIMEI

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849



