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Summer Lee  (LKK Auto)

From: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 2 July, 2020 5:34 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: Loganathan Agoram; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim

Subject: FW: 回复： RE: ACCIENT INVOLVING SJH4415A AND SJZ9898L ON 30 JUNE 2020. || 

C10006613 

Attachments: SJZ9898L.pdf; SJH4415A.pdf

Hi Team, 

 

We would  like to request TP PRS for SJH4415A.  TP chose Mr. Adrian Ling to survey this vehicle. 

 

Workshop information: 

JEC Auto Service 

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #02-11. 

AutoBay @Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 417883 

Person In Charge: Ah Xian Tel: 9232 7457; Fax: 65096584 

 

Please confirm.  Thank you. 

 

 

Regards, 

 

 

Ivy Ratilla 

Executive, Claims Admin 

 

T +65 6540 2185 

F +65 6725 0853   

E ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg  
 

 
 

Customer Care +65 6221 2111 

Claims +65 6221 2199 

Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 

 

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 

Singapore Shopping Centre 

Singapore 

239924                                                                                                                                  

budgetdirect.com.sg 

 

 
 

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget 

Direct Insurance. 
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This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & 

General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) 

reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is 

confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, 

confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this 

email is unauthorised.  

 

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is 

for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the 

stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may 

be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, 

interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.  

 

From: autoservice Jec <jecautoservice@yahoo.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 2 July 2020 9:46 AM 

To: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>; alfred_ng@juseq.com.sg; Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Cc: Loganathan Agoram <loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Subject: 回复： RE: ACCIENT INVOLVING SJH4415A AND SJZ9898L ON 30 JUNE 2020. || C10006613  

 

Mr Adrian ling (lkk) 

 

 

发自 iPhone 版 Yahoo 邮箱 

星期四, 七月 2, 2020, 09:34 于 Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>写道： 

From: alfred_ng@juseq.com.sg <alfred_ng@juseq.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 1 July 2020 5:27 PM 

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Cc: jecautoservice@yahoo.com.sg 

Subject: ACCIENT INVOLVING SJH4415A AND SJZ9898L ON 30 JUNE 2020. 

  

Your ref:SJZ9898L 

Our ref: JEQ/SJH4415A/JEC 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

We act for the owner of vehicle no. SJH4415A. 

  

We hereby notify you of a road traffic accident on 30 June 2020 at about 2145 hrs, along Sims Ave 

involving our client’s vehicle and vehicle registration no. SJZ9898L driven by you / your insured at 

the material time. A copy of our client’s accident report is enclosed. 
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As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceeds to 

repair the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice 

whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply 

from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle without 

further reference to you. 

  

With Regards 

  

Alfred Ng   

Executive 

Legal Division 

On behalf of Mr. Michael Yap 

M/s JusEquity Law Corporation  

No. 133 New Bridge Road  

Chinatown Point 

#10-03 Singapore 059413  

Tel : 6536 9339 

Fax: 6536 5368 

  

IMPORTANT NOTICE: 

This message is intended only for the attention of the addressee and may contain legally privileged 

and/or confidential information. Its unauthorised use, disclosure, storage or copying is not 

permitted. If you are not the intended recipient, please permanently delete the original, destroy all 

copies and inform the sender. 

  

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) 

Services Pte. Limited, Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) 

and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect 

the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is 

confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, 

confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of 

this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the 

sender and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus 

free.  

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited, 

Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee. 

The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect 

views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the 

intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure 

of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then 

delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.  


