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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 8 October 2020 2:06 PM

To: catherinechua@eurokars.com.sg

Cc: 'Ronald Yap'; SUR

Subject: RE: SLS2202D - FINALIZATION OF COR 

Dear Catherine, 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Confirm final fig $6,775.40 before GST and 4 repair days. 

 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 28 September 2020 5:33 PM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: SLS2202D - FINALIZATION OF COR  

 

Hi 

CS/CTI20006911/Aqf3 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 

 

From: Catherine Chua <catherine.chua@eurokars.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 28 September, 2020 4:50 PM 

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg> 

Subject: SLS2202D - FINALIZATION OF COR  

 

Dear Adrian 

 

Our COR computation is attached for your agreement.  

COR: $6775.40 before GST 

4 repair days (not including preparation of estimate, wait for survey/authorization/spare parts, Sat/Sun/PH) 

 

Kindly confirm the above as soon as possible 

 

Note : Documents are sent by email only 
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Thanks n Regards  

 
Catherine Chua  

Insurance Claims Executive 

T: (65) 6331 0680 D: (65) 6331 0691 

E: catherine.chua@eurokars.com.sg     

 
This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is 

confidential and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then 

delete this message from your system. Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other 

person. Thank you. 

 


