Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jessica Harry Shastri <jessica.shastri@eurokars.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 16 October 2020 3:11 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Cc: Insurance Claims; Ng Bee Yean

Subject: RE: Accident involving SKQ537Z & SLM469X on 24/6/2020

Dear Jasper,

Please refer to the below details.

Account Name EUROKARS SERVICES PTE LTD
Account Number 003-905300-2

Bank Name DBS BANK LTD

Bank & Branch Code 7171/ 003

Thanks & Regards,
Jessica

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>

Sent: 16 October 2020 2:34 PM

To: Jessica Harry Shastri <jessica.shastri@eurokars.com.sg>

Cc: Insurance Claims <insuranceclaims@eurokars.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Accident involving SKQ537Z & SLM469X on 24/6/2020

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Jessica,
Please be informed that EQ is moving into E-payment modes.

Kindly provide us your workshop’s bank details for payment.

Account Name
Account Number
Bank Name

Bank & Branch Code

Thanks

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 16 October 2020 1:54 PM

To: Jessica Harry Shastri <jessica.shastri@eurokars.com.sg>

Cc: Insurance Claims <insuranceclaims@eurokars.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Accident involving SKQ537Z & SLM469X on 24/6/2020




