Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 October 2020 8:42 am

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: Fw: GBD5355Z  DOA:23/06/2020  TP/CHINA

Attachments: S-chmys20101418220.pdf; DSC_4627.JPG; DSC_4628.JPG; DSC_4629.JPG; DSC_4630.JPG;

IMG_8922.JPG; IMG_8936.JPG; IMG_8933.JPG; DSC_5095.JPG; DSC_5096.JPG

From: Efeeda (Cheng Hoe) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 14 October 2020 6:28 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>
Subject: GBD5355Z DOA:23/06/2020 TP/CHINA

Hi Kenneth,

Finalization and photos attached.

Please let us have your confirmation on the final sum- $3700/ 5 days via reply email.
Thank you.

Rgds

Efeeda

Cheng Hoe Motor PL

Tel:67556142
Fax:67557719



