
4/2/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMkAGU0ZDViNzgxLWE5MTItNDkxMi1hZWIxLTA3MjhlMTA0N2RiNgBGAAAAAADl7f6wE2MfQpF%2B… 1/35

Re: LOD : Accident involving SKV4659C and SFP6084M(AIG) on 29.06.2020 *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG20006797/Aka3

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Fri 2/4/2021 12:58 PM
To:  kangcar@singnet.com.sg <kangcar@singnet.com.sg>
Cc:  Kang Car (yahoo) <kangcar176@yahoo.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

1 attachments (192 KB)
DV_SKV4659C.pdf;

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

We confirm se�lement at a global sum of $3,400.00(all-in).

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return together with youor client authorisa�on to act us (LKK) for our necessary
ac�on.

“Kindly note that this nego�a�on between par�es on this ma�er is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole inten�on of resolving the ma�er

amicably without par�es resor�ng to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this nego�a�on of

terms/se�lement. 
 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of

liability/damages, either party is not bound, therea�er, by the nego�a�on terms/se�lement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: kangcar@singnet.com.sg <kangcar@singnet.com.sg> 
Sent: Wednesday, 31 March 2021 11:48 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Kang Car (yahoo) <kangcar176@yahoo.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: LOD : Accident involving SKV4659C and SFP6084M(AIG) on 29.06.2020 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG20006797/Aka3
 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

Apologized for the typo error. Settled at G/S $3,400.00 (all in). 

Thank you & Regards,  
Sharon 
Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd  
Tel: 6747 7636  

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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Fax: 6748 5071 

On Wed Mar 31 2021 11:46:55 GMT+0800 (Singapore Standard Time) <kangcar@singnet.com.sg>
wrote: 
---------- Original Message ---------- 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

We refer to your email below.  

For an amicable settlement, we confirmed acceptance on your offer at G/S $4000.00 (all in).  

Kindly forward us the DV for our action.  

Thank you & Regards,  
Sharon 
Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd  
Tel: 6747 7636  
Fax: 6748 5071 

On Mon Mar 29 2021 15:32:50 GMT+0800 (Singapore Standard Time) Hsiao Tong
(LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
---------- Original Message ---------- 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We propose settlement at a global sum of $3,400.00(all-in). 
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Please confirm acceptance. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis
with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings.
No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of
terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party
that will materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not
bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

 
Best Regards, 
 
 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) 
| Case Handler 

 
 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
 
 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com 
| Fax: 6741 4108 

 
 
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933) 
 

 

From: 
Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Thursday, 18 March 2021 8:46 AM 
To: kangcar@singnet.com.sg 
Cc: Kang Car (yahoo) <kangcar176@yahoo.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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Subject: RE: LOD : Accident involving SKV4659C and SFP6084M(AIG) on 29.06.2020 ***
LKK REF: CC6/AIG20006797/Aka3 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

We are pending mandate approval from AIG. 

  

We will follow up and get back to you. 

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis
with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings.
No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of
terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party
that will materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not
bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 
 
 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) 
| Case Handler 

 
 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
 
 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com 
| Fax: 6741 4108 

 
 
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933) 
 

 

  

  

From: 
kangcar@singnet.com.sg <kangcar@singnet.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 17 March 2021 11:42 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Kang Car (yahoo) <kangcar176@yahoo.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: LOD : Accident involving SKV4659C and SFP6084M(AIG) on 29.06.2020 ***
LKK REF: CC6/AIG20006797/Aka3 

  

  

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE / REMINDER 

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:kangcar@singnet.com.sg
mailto:kangcar@singnet.com.sg
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:kangcar176@yahoo.com.sg
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
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We refer to the above matter and our LOD dated 23.11.2020. 

  

Kindly let us have your offer asap.  

  

Thank you & Regards,  

Sharon 

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd  

Tel: 6747 7636  

Fax: 6748 5071 

  

  

On Wed Jan 13 2021 10:36:08 GMT+0800 (Singapore Standard Time)
<kangcar@singnet.com.sg> wrote: 

---------- Original Message ---------- 

  

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

  

mailto:kangcar@singnet.com.sg
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Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

As requested, please see attached.  

  

  

Thank you & Regards,  

Sharon 

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd  

Tel: 6747 7636  

Fax: 6748 5071 

  

  

  

On Thu Jan 07 2021 09:38:26 GMT+0800 (Singapore Standard
Time) Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

---------- Original Message ---------- 

  

  

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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Without Prejudice 

  

  

  

  

  

Hi Sharon, 

  

  

  

  

  

Kindly provide after repair photos for SKV4659C. 

  

  

Thanks. 
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on
a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter
amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of
terms/settlement. 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently
produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on
the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound,
thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 
 
 
  
 
 
  
 
 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) 
 
 
| Case Handler 
 
 
  
 
 
  
 
 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
 
 
  
 
 
  
 
 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com 
 
 
| Fax: 6741 4108 
 
 

 

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933) 
 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

From: 

kangcar@singnet.com.sg <kangcar@singnet.com.sg>  

Sent: 
Wednesday, 6 January 2021 12:02 PM 

To: 
Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 
Kang Car (yahoo) <kangcar176@yahoo.com.sg>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: 
Fwd: LOD : Accident involving SKV4659C and SFP6084M(AIG) on
29.06.2020 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG20006797/Aka3 

mailto:kangcar@singnet.com.sg
mailto:kangcar@singnet.com.sg
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:kangcar176@yahoo.com.sg
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

  

  

  

  

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 
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FYNA. 

  

  

  

  

  

Thank you & Regards,  

  

  

Sharon 

  

  

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd  
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Tel: 6747 7636  

  

  

Fax: 6748 5071 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

On Mon Nov 23 2020 11:40:52 GMT+0800 (Singapore
Standard Time) <kangcar@singnet.com.sg> wrote: 

  

  

mailto:kangcar@singnet.com.sg
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---------- Original Message ---------- 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

  

  

  

  

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 
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We refer to the above accident and attach
herewith our LOD for your reference. 

  

  

Kindly look into the matter and please let us
have your offer to settle our client's claim. 

  

  

  

  

  

Thank you & Regards,  

  

  

Sharon 
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Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd  

  

  

Tel: 6747 7636  

  

  

Fax: 6748 5071 
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From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
<khanchna@lkkauto.com> 

  

  

  

  

  

To: 

kangcar@singnet.com.sg
<kangcar@singnet.com.sg> 

  

  

Cc: 

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd
<kangcar@kangcarrepairers.com.sg>;
Kang Car (yahoo)
<kangcar176@yahoo.com.sg>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

  

  

Sent: 

mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com
mailto:kangcar@singnet.com.sg
mailto:kangcar@singnet.com.sg
mailto:kangcar@kangcarrepairers.com.sg
mailto:kangcar176@yahoo.com.sg
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
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Monday, 3 August 2020, 02:02:28 pm SGT 

  

  

Subject: 

RE: Accident involving SKV4659C and
SFP6084M(AIG) on 29.06.2020 *** LKK
REF: CC6/AIG20006797/Aka3 

  

  

  

  

  

Without Prejudice 
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Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

  

  

  

  

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

  

  

  

  

  

Please be informed that basing on the
accident statements submitted by both
parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
(subject to BOLA guideline settlement)
and shall proceed with direct settlement
for the above mentioned case. 
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Please note that this e-mail is on without
prejudice basis which does not amount to
an authorisation of repair to your client’s
vehicle. 

  

  

  

  

  

The final repair cost is subjected to the
consistency of the damages according to
the nature of the accident. 

  

  

  

  

  

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based
on the number of days of repair as
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recommended by our surveyor. 

  

  

  

  

  

  

Please note that all finalisation subject
insurer’s approval. 
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between
parties on this matter is purely on a without
prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without
parties resorting to legal proceedings. No
admission of liability, whatsoever, should
be deemed / inferred from this negotiation
of terms/settlement. 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

In the event of new evidence being
discovered or subsequently produced by
either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound,
thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

  

  

Khanchna 
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| Case Handler 

  

  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

  

  

  

DID: 6841 2360| email:
Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108 

  

  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi
Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

  

  

mailto:Khanchna@lkkauto.com%7C


4/2/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMkAGU0ZDViNzgxLWE5MTItNDkxMi1hZWIxLTA3MjhlMTA0N2RiNgBGAAAAAADl7f6wE2MfQpF%2… 26/35

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
<Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 27 July 2020 9:51 AM 
To: kangcar@singnet.com.sg; Khanchna (LKK
Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd
<kangcar@kangcarrepairers.com.sg>; Kang
Car (yahoo) <kangcar176@yahoo.com.sg>;
Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident involving SKV4659C
and SFP6084M(AIG) on 29.06.2020 *** LKK
REF: CC6/AIG20006797/Aka3

  

  

  

  

  

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com
mailto:kangcar@singnet.com.sg
mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com
mailto:kangcar@kangcarrepairers.com.sg
mailto:kangcar176@yahoo.com.sg
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com


4/2/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMkAGU0ZDViNzgxLWE5MTItNDkxMi1hZWIxLTA3MjhlMTA0N2RiNgBGAAAAAADl7f6wE2MfQpF%2… 27/35

Thank you for your email. 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

Our respective case handler will look into the
matter and get back to you in due course. 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

Hi Khanchna, 
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Kindly assist. 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may
contact the undersigned. 
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Thank you. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

  

  

  

Mei Kwan | Admin 

  

  

  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax:

67414108

  

  

  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933) 

  

  

  

 

  

  

  

Note: We are on work from home
arrangement. All correspondence should
be made via email.  Submission of claim

mailto:MeiKwan@lkkauto.com
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related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted 

  

  

  

  

  

  

From: kangcar@singnet.com.sg
<kangcar@singnet.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 27 July, 2020 9:50 AM 
To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd
<kangcar@kangcarrepairers.com.sg>; Kang
Car (yahoo) <kangcar176@yahoo.com.sg> 
Subject: Accident involving SKV4659C and
SFP6084M(AIG) on 29.06.2020

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

mailto:kangcar@singnet.com.sg
mailto:kangcar@singnet.com.sg
mailto:cs-a@lkkauto.com
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

  

  

  

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

  

  

  

  

We refer to the above matter. 
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Our client's vehicle was surveyed by
Adrian Ling on 29.06.2020.  

  

  

  

  

  

We would like to proceed for Direct
Settlement and kindly advise if your
insured reported the accident and the
liability. 
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Kindly revert.  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

Thank you & Regards, 

  

  

Sharon 

  

  

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd 
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Tel: 6747 7636 

  

  

Fax: 6748 5071 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  


