
To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 24/08/2021

Your Ref. No. :  DM20HO00943/SG

Our Ref. No. : CC4/EQI20006749/R1gs3q2

: $ 4,500.00         

: $ days

Rental (If any)      : $ 856.00            8 days 

: $ 16.00              

: $

5,372.00         

: $ 5,372.00         

:

 

1)                   : $ 5,372.00                                

                  : $

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

JOANNE LEE

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

Remarks 

Loss of Use

Final Repair Cost

(Insd Veh)
Vehicle No.

24/6/2020

GBF 7327G

SKV 8763H

Date of Accident

   (TP Veh)

100%

XINYA AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

Others:

Final Settlement Sum 

Liability



















Our Ref:  CC4/EQI20006749/gs3 
 
29 JUNE 2020 
 
CALLMIFRAME PTE LTD 
215 HENDERSON ROAD 
#02-06 HENDERSON INDUSTRIAL PARK 
SINGAPORE 159554 
Driver: ONG BEE HARN 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF7327G AND SKV8763H ON 24/06/2020 
 
We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster 
Company by your Motor Insurer (EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED) to resolve 
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy 
taken up with them. 
 
This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SKV8763H. 
  
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will 
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and 
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. 
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this 
claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries.  
 
Yours faithfully, 

 
CECILIA CHONG 
Case Handler 
DID:  6749 4274 
FAX: 6741 4108 
EMAIL: ceciliachong@lkkauto.com 
 
c.c. EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED 
            (Motor Claims Dept) 
 



1

Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 16 August 2021 1:40 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: RECOMMENDATION OF REPAIR COST TO SKV 8763H

 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Monday, August 16, 2021 12:36 PM 
To: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: RECOMMENDATION OF REPAIR COST TO SKV 8763H 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
Please be informed that EQ is moving into E-payment modes. 
  
Please fill up workshop’s bank details as follow:  
  

Account Name XINYA AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD 
Account Number  524-700333-001 
Bank Name  OCBC BANK 
Bank & Branch Code  BANK CODE 524 BRANCH CODE 7339 

  
 
 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>  
Sent: Saturday, 14 August 2021 3:29 PM 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: RECOMMENDATION OF REPAIR COST TO SKV 8763H 


