Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Danny,

Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Tuesday, 1 September 2020 11:25 AM

Danny Loh

Admin A

RE: LOD EL818K/ LKK ref : CC4/ASM20006695/Kba3
DS.pdf

As spoken, thanks for the acceptance of 3,700.00(all in)

Please duly sign the document enclosed and return together with the following document to us (LKK) for

our necessary action: -

e Original Authorisation to Act

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 20 August 2020 12:14 PM

To: Danny Loh <lohheng0308 @yahoo.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LOD EL818K/ LKK ref : CC4/ASM20006695/Kba3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your email.

We propose a settlement at a global sum of $3,700.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.



In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Danny Loh <lohheng0308@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 17 August 2020 2:54 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LOD EL818K/ LKK ref : CC4/ASM20006695/Kba3

Dear Jasper,
As spoken, we reject your offered. as been too low .
Thanks

Danny

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Fri, 14 Aug 2020 at 15:21, Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
<jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your email.

We propose a settlement at a global sum of $3,350.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.



In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Danny Loh <lohheng0308 @yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 23 July 2020 9:49 AM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: LOD EL818K

Dear Jasper,

we attached the LOD for EL818K for your perusal.

Kind regards,

Loh Heng

Danny



