Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 July 2020 4:53 PM
To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: GBD 7088G

Please upload the COE Rebate in View system.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 July 2020 3:07 PM
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: GBD 7088G

There will be no direct settlement on this case as repairer unable to accept limit repair of $3500.00
offered. They will be using independent report.



