9/9/2020 Mail - Asher Sng (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: Liability for SMC3533P Your ref: D20002540MFSH Ouir ref:
SMC3533P(D.0.A:11/06/2020)

Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Wed 9/9/2020 1:37 PM
To: City Auto <cityauto@singnet.com.sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client move out
of the parking lot and collided into insured vehicle.

We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client’s favor.

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability
and unable to look into your client’s claim.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: City Auto <cityauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, July 13, 2020 1:11 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Liability for SMC3533P Your ref: D20002540MFSH Our ref: SMC3533P(D.0.A:11/06/2020)

Hi Asher,

Can we settle this case in liability 50/50?

Any video footage or evidence for this matter?
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vronica Law
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City Auto Pte Ltd

Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate,
#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road,
Singapore 575643

Tel : 6453 1235

Fax : 6453 7944

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 13 July, 2020 12:30 PM

To: City Auto

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Liability for SMC3533P Your ref: D20002540MFSH Our ref: SMC3533P(D.0.A:11/06/2020)

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sir,

Enclosed for your easy refernece.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: City Auto <cityauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, July 13, 2020 11:47 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Liability for SMC3533P Your ref: D20002540MFSH Our ref: SMC3533P(D.0.A:11/06/2020)

Hi Asher,

Please forward us your insured’s GIA report.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vronica Law

City Auto Pte Ltd

Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate,
#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road,
Singapore 575643

Tel : 6453 1235

Fax : 6453 7944
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From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 13 July, 2020 11:45 AM

To: City Auto

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Liability for SMC3533P Your ref: D20002540MFSH Our ref: SMC3533P(D.0.A:11/06/2020)

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Vronica,

We refer to the email below.

We have review the liability and is not in your clients favor.

We will seek approval from our principal to review the matter.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: City Auto <cityauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, July 13, 2020 11:29 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Liability for SMC3533P Your ref: D20002540MFSH Our ref: SMC3533P(D.0.A:11/06/2020)

RE-SEND...

Hi Asher,

Any update for this case?
Kindly assist.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vronica Law

City Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate,
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#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road,
Singapore 575643

Tel : 6453 1235

Fax : 6453 7944

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) [mailto:suli@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 25 June, 2020 1:28 PM

To: City Auto

Cc: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Liability for SMC3533P Your ref: D20002540MFSH Our ref: SMC3533P(D.0.A:11/06/2020)

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Asher,

FYNA, our ref CC4/FCI20006652/es3

* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li | Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6261 5037 Email: SuLi@lkkauto.com| Fax : 6271 8802

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
Branch : Blk 1007, Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-11 | S(159721)

From: City Auto [mailto:cityauto@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 25 June 2020 11:53 AM

To: Admin A

Subject: Liability for SMC3533P Your ref: D20002540MFSH Our ref: SMC3533P(D.0.A:11/06/2020)

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please let us know what is the liability for this case.
Kindly check and revert to us.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vronica Law

City Auto Pte Ltd

BIk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate,

#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road,
Singapore 575643
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Tel : 6453 1235
Fax : 6453 7944
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